



Safe Roads to Prosperity

**Executive Summary of Bid Evaluation Report**  
**MAINTENANCE OF BITUMEN ROADS IN THE**  
**KEETMANSHOOP REGION**

**Reference Number: W/ONB/RA-05/2017 - KHP**

**1. Scope of Contract:**

The Works are *the Routine Maintenance on Bitumen Roads in the Keetmanshoop Region*, with reference number W/ONB/RA-05/2017 - KHP

The names and identifications of the Contract Areas included in this document are as listed below:

LIST OF CONTRACT AREAS		
No	CONTRACT AREA	REGION
1	BMU-KHP 03	Keetmanshoop
2	BMU-KHP 04	Keetmanshoop
3	BMU-KHP 05	Keetmanshoop
4	BMU-KHP 06	Keetmanshoop
5	BMU-KHP 07	Keetmanshoop
6	BMU-KHP 08	Keetmanshoop
7	BMU-KHP 09	Keetmanshoop
8	BMU-KHP 10	Keetmanshoop

Each Contract Area is regarded as a separate Contract and will be awarded separately.

Bidders may submit bids for any number of Contract Areas. The Roads Authority reserves the right to award different Contract Areas to different Bidders or to award more than one Contract Area to the same Bidder.

**2. Procurement method used:**

Open National Bidding

**3. Date of Invitation of Bids**

08 December 2017

**4. Closing date for submission of bids**

14 February 2018 at 10H00

**5. Date and place of opening of bids**

14 February 2018 at 10H00. Bids were submitted in the tender box located at Roads Authority, Corner Mandume Ndemufayo Avenue & David Hosea Meroro Road, Southern Industrial Area, Windhoek.

**6. Number of bids received by closing date:**

62 bids were received

## 7. Responsiveness of bids:

Bidders Name	Bid Price in Namibian Dollars (N\$)								Responsive or not responsive (Yes/ No)
	Karasburg 03	Karasburg 04	Keetmanshoop 05	Keetmanshoop 06	Keetmanshoop 07	Keetmanshoop 08	Mariental 09	Mariental 10	
Potenza Investments cc	21,118,025.23	16,194,952.30	15,617,650.58	14,340,619.86	14,695,701.97	14,093,625.85	15,307,637.78	13,669,836.08	Yes
V.M. FREDRICKS TRADING CC	11,021,747.20	11,021,747.20	12,398,055.70	11,507,699.25	11,507,699.25	10,379,532.00	11,326,401.75	11,326,401.75	No
Khankan Trading Enterprises cc	14,619,096.70	11,757,951.20	13,825,994.60	12,752,321.25	12,538,323.50	13,763,366.75	12,346,386.20	11,889,261.20	No
Namib JJ Investments	12,540,441.80	13,681,067.00	11,664,562.13	12,121,934.38	11,060,182.50	10,346,837.50	12,469,910.00	9,646,384.00	No
Matesu Trading Enterprises cc	12,540,441.80	13,681,067.00	11,664,562.13	12,121,934.38	11,060,182.50	10,346,837.50	12,469,910.00	9,646,384.00	No
GI Smit Construction	11,527,363.10	9,990,349.00	11,427,601.75	10,502,409.50	10,517,934.50	10,017,845.50	12,188,073.75	10,669,418.25	No
Colonel Investment cc			14,209,894.50	12,401,462.72	12,163,422.92		13,657,678.30	12,657,145.52	No
//Gowases Trading Enterprises cc	12,141,875.95	10,857,748.00	11,860,767.65	11,014,090.50	10,473,297.25	10,543,481.75	11,344,364.75	9,777,586.35	No
Pelico Engineering Group cc	12,329,018.58	11,279,150.09	13,927,067.64	11,197,118.18	11,497,022.65	11,681,720.42	11,574,218.30	10,446,611.35	Yes
Ramamor Construction cc	12,735,668.45	11,426,168.85	13,169,241.27	11,213,031.90	11,742,968.67	10,736,479.35	10,916,461.46	9,876,073.13	No
Grey Wolf Investment cc	11,918,216.66	10,583,082.80	10,522,297.80	11,368,063.50	11,254,545.65	10,232,357.00	11,350,435.65		No
Tuckers Builders & Civil Works	11,667,655.83	10,729,030.98	12,614,961.50	11,696,608.13	12,242,580.29	11,106,284.68	12,450,723.91	10,972,481.59	Yes

Gwandombe Trading cc	52,416,266.30	46,849,183.00	58,104,865.50	56,861,916.75	47,658,231.00	33,618,180.10	40,475,664.50	33,546,615.50	No
D.P.D Civil and Road Maintenance cc	11,273,873.20	11,270,356.50	13,174,014.75	12,628,365.25	13,991,871.75	9,063,431.75	11,483,106.50	10,034,474.50	No
Hibachi Investments Holdings Pty(Ltd)	12,517,849.57	12,185,259.49	13,259,569.95	11,232,753.20	12,151,480.04	10,720,769.00	14,517,673.34	13,085,381.26	Yes
John Namusheshe Construction	12,554,585.28	11,461,546.99	13,956,068.34	12,596,707.05	12,654,997.67	11,800,886.39	13,245,857.95	11,299,819.90	No
Goreseb Trading cc	11,972,014.79	10,947,757.35	13,027,943.48	11,924,092.42	12,189,873.33	13,300,389.75	12,537,808.88	10,843,511.35	No
F. A Developers	15,707,821.16	12,926,649.41	15,111,963.84	14,809,863.01	14,123,771.08	13,967,372.38	14,347,401.44	13,043,197.21	No
WT Business Group cc	11,902,104.40	13,088,495.00	14,144,450.88	13,473,759.38	12,598,767.50	10,696,437.50	12,170,565.00	9,624,361.50	No
N R K Technical Services cc	10,567,879.00	9,521,119.10	11,116,282.95	10,303,958.60	10,079,950.10	9,904,343.95	11,030,928.80	9,703,889.75	Yes
S.F.E Investments cc	8,414,124.40	6,453,145.13	6,611,951.51	6,831,019.61	7,865,276.71	7,392,059.76	7,881,909.18	7,949,269.26	No
Dinaledi Investments cc	-	-	-	-	-	-	16,930,551.79	15,125,572.23	No
Nilotse Investments cc	12,801,780.91	11,142,040.65	12,380,930.36	11,482,694.00	11,987,951.44	10,895,366.28	11,764,036.09	10,405,287.80	Yes
Ismsan Investments cc JV Mr. T & Ms T Investments cc	12,042,847.27	11,408,969.45	12,238,917.84	11,299,050.44	11,523,881.48	10,778,248.50	12,372,847.70	11,185,027.77	No
Donn Y Investments cc	10,669,534.40	10,262,945.00	10,150,615.88	10,445,234.38	9,716,062.50	9,034,687.50	10,407,327.50	8,343,261.50	No
Brumar Construction cc	13,657,037.96	13,313,817.93	15,008,572.31	13,663,323.88	14,149,750.62	13,529,130.40	14,466,025.06	12,442,387.29	Yes

Hui Tani Trading Enterprises cc	11,568,949.40	12,824,570.00	11,630,982.13	12,228,596.88	11,086,373.75	10,366,962.50	12,347,463.75	9,558,351.50	No
Menell Investments cc	10,859,229.59	9,949,886.87	11,709,438.12	10,862,272.39	11,364,536.52	10,316,619.04	11,555,530.73	10,192,187.09	No
Rika's Trading enterprises cc	9,692,336.85	8,684,234.20	9,868,659.45	9,029,607.95	8,832,506.00	8,960,854.05	10,191,512.75	8,989,251.00	No

Earth Ethicks cc	12,865,778.39	10,642,750.46	13,048,696.35	10,851,351.78	12,113,229.94	10,596,017.40	12,883,929.04	10,763,786.55	No
Odjove Trading and Construction cc	12,253,142.38	10,702,857.65	12,714,441.81	11,140,022.91	11,694,848.67	11,188,919.37	11,577,540.52	11,253,603.08	Yes
Makopa Investments	11,521,245.97	13,330,306.05	12,552,752.22	12,392,139.77	11,209,755.41	11,829,259.43	14,051,902.81	14,467,694.06	No
Jeremias Construction	12,556,717.70	10,331,374.07	13,827,750.52	12,756,691.64	13,383,111.42	11,216,630.80	13,541,448.71	12,625,081.27	No
Kauna Builders cc	13,584,042.88	12,299,750.25	14,244,756.75	12,957,820.50	13,520,877.75	12,149,123.25	13,607,472.75	11,908,520.25	Yes
Southern Cross Business Enterprises cc	11,533,988.25	10,209,090.50	12,626,557.25	11,546,799.25	11,829,141.50	10,708,685.00	11,620,945.50	10,732,858.00	No
Motinga Trading Enterprises	14,597,819.40	15,009,987.05	14,634,775.22	13,543,621.88	13,608,154.13	12,327,167.98	16,473,732.87	14,929,578.30	No
Peacefull Trading Enterprises cc	13,311,550.40	12,913,324.13	14,141,275.73	12,657,757.58	11,888,157.23	11,777,794.08	13,127,160.23	11,663,134.54	No
Alugodhi construction and Renovation cc	10,610,913.82	10,084,786.45	11,946,070.45	11,158,215.37	11,573,883.48	10,537,907.41	11,821,626.33	10,404,381.57	Yes
Pandu Construction cc	10,649,754.60	9,859,563.00	10,762,351.50	10,048,751.00	10,354,771.00	9,690,657.00	11,141,958.50	9,985,264.50	No
Nena Electrical and Civil Engineering cc	28,768,996.34	28,382,470.88	37,849,805.90	34,596,441.77	33,966,797.15	21,910,278.34	27,974,269.33	22,982,095.31	No

Golden West Investments	11,632,879.79	10,766,885.35	12,596,693.48	11,600,654.92	11,974,248.33	12,869,139.75	11,732,808.88	10,843,511.35	No
Geronny Invesment cc	13,560,623.75	12,127,820.88	13,004,226.46	12,015,138.07	11,429,540.13	10,440,745.18	11,803,079.97	10,273,194.64	No
Mbatjoo Trading Enterprises	9,237,253.17	7,867,541.58	8,925,514.50	8,221,571.79	9,159,913.28	9,831,990.78	8,301,074.44	8,493,087.74	No
Centurion Investments cc	12,282,373.82	10,654,035.83	12,491,192.06	11,190,342.75	11,749,442.29	11,180,335.95	12,325,174.66	11,211,425.96	No
Jorome Trading Enterprises	17,752,133.41		16,174,938.32	15,002,539.96	14,748,412.19	17,037,366.00			No
Queen Mwetako Investments cc	12,550,652.08	10,589,725.32	11,976,414.24	11,678,158.86	11,653,232.33	9,970,753.52	10,858,401.78	9,130,667.88	No
RCC Projects	12,303,399.52	11,284,640.14	12,910,624.96	11,781,199.43	11,982,486.76	10,673,730.77	12,401,084.41	10,868,898.60	No
Inek Investments cc	12,473,759.26	11,454,037.49	13,946,281.84	12,584,215.17	12,639,200.98	11,780,042.64	13,236,271.27	11,287,727.65	No
Sacky Mbandy Trading	12,477,484.68	11,457,958.99	13,950,203.34	12,589,117.05	12,643,612.67	11,789,846.39	13,240,682.95	11,293,609.90	No
Sumseno Contracting	14,121,862.00	12,453,120.00	13,182,352.25	12,150,353.75	12,568,695.00	11,363,380.00	13,174,687.50	12,058,641.25	No
Flexis Investments cc	11,667,655.83	10,729,030.98	12,614,961.50	11,696,608.13	12,242,580.29	11,107,284.68	12,450,723.91	10,972,481.59	No
Lee Roadworks and Trading	10,502,124.44	9,522,953.86	11,983,941.48	9,843,523.84	10,727,701.95	10,573,124.98	11,486,275.33	9,289,212.58	No
Pefimbo Renovations & Auctioneering Services	12,730,670.20	11,150,825.50	11,994,896.75	11,108,356.00	11,685,943.50	10,804,168.35	11,742,063.50	10,050,241.00	No
Buchter Bricks and Blocks	10,180,071.40	9,894,542.50	10,445,274.63	10,576,190.63	9,909,521.25	9,091,612.50	10,320,128.75	8,293,639.00	No
Extreme Road Construction	14,636,861.67	12,973,612.30	14,976,305.33	13,697,369.40	14,194,553.50	12,658,156.95	13,867,114.00	12,307,363.25	No
All Roads Contractor cc	11,718,182.60	11,519,377.50	13,393,463.50	12,180,800.00	12,272,506.75	9,484,515.75	13,166,562.75	11,803,433.25	No

Poburke Trading Enterprises	13,130,072.10	12,653,900.00	14,017,327.00	12,831,573.50	12,984,598.25	12,093,440.25	13,995,517.25	12,471,911.00	No
Hoeb Road Constructions and Renovations	12,850,508.25	11,623,027.00	14,318,213.00	16,368,553.75	12,048,885.80	11,334,963.50	10,959,149.25	10,621,566.75	No
Ngatatjosi Road Construction	11,779,445.00	10,613,350.00	18,715,215.00	10,480,284.00	13,026,556.00	13,449,307.00	18,540,127.00	7,985,151.50	No
Bondelswartz Investments	13,001,468.06	12,496,904.96							No
Wilvic Trading Enterprises	12,124,382.73	11,632,486.83	12,523,477.20	11,570,075.58	11,629,715.30	11,047,866.02	12,565,241.48	10,445,203.89	No
Alnaa Capital Investment cc	16,689,582.71	12,648,852.35	14,917,455.98	13,753,675.41	13,432,676.81	15,386,040.37	13,578,006.17	11,543,753.97	No

The table indicates the bids that were not responsive with the reasons why it was not responsive

Bidder's Name	Pricing at Bid Opening N\$	Responsive or not responsive (Yes/ No)	Reasons why bid is not responsive
V.M. FREDRICKS TRADING CC	<i>As indicated in table above</i>	No	No bid security submitted
Namib JJ Investments	<i>As indicated in table above</i>	No	No bid security submitted
Matesu Trading Enterprises cc	<i>As indicated in table above</i>	No	No bid security submitted
Grey Wolf Investment cc	<i>As indicated in table above</i>	No	No bid security submitted
Gwandombe Trading cc	<i>As indicated in table above</i>	No	No bid security submitted
John Namushese	<i>As indicated in table above</i>	No	No bid security submitted
W T Business Group cc	<i>As indicated in table above</i>	No	No bid security submitted
S F E Investments	<i>As indicated in table above</i>	No	No bid security submitted
Jerimia Construction cc	<i>As indicated in table above</i>	No	No bid security submitted
Motinga Trading Enterprises	<i>As indicated in table above</i>	No	No bid security submitted
Peacefull Trading Enterprises cc	<i>As indicated in table above</i>	No	No bid security submitted
Pandu Construction cc	<i>As indicated in table above</i>	No	No bid security submitted
Geronny Invesment cc	<i>As indicated in table above</i>	No	No bid security submitted
Sacky Mbandy Trading	<i>As indicated in table above</i>	No	No bid security submitted
All Roads Contractor	<i>As indicated in table above</i>	No	No bid security submitted
Hoeb Road Constructions and Renovations	<i>As indicated in table above</i>	No	No bid security submitted
Ngatatjosi Road Construction	<i>As indicated in table above</i>	No	No bid security submitted

Bondelswartz Investments	<i>As indicated in table above</i>	No	No bid security submitted
Wilvic Trading Enterprises	<i>As indicated in table above</i>	No	No bid security submitted
Khankan Trading Enterprises cc	<i>As indicated in table above</i>	No	Bidder <u>HAS NOT</u> submitted the duly filled in, signed, stamped, and dated Bid Submission Sheet Form
GI Smit Construction	<i>As indicated in table above</i>	No	Bidder <u>HAS NOT</u> submitted the duly filled in, signed, stamped, and dated Bid Submission Sheet Form
Hui Tani Trading Enterprises cc	<i>As indicated in table above</i>	No	Bidder <u>HAS NOT</u> submitted the duly filled in, signed, stamped, and dated Bid Submission Sheet Form
Nena Electrical and Civil Engineering cc	<i>As indicated in table above</i>	No	Bidder <u>HAS NOT</u> submitted the duly filled in, signed, stamped, and dated Bid Submission Sheet Form
Poburke Trading Enterprises	<i>As indicated in table above</i>	No	Bidder <u>HAS NOT</u> submitted the duly filled in, signed, stamped, and dated Bid Submission Sheet Form
Ramamor Construction cc	<i>As indicated in table above</i>	No	Bidder <u>DOES NOT</u> have a valid certified copy of Affirmative Action Compliance Certificate, proof from Employment Equity Commissioner that bidder is not a relevant employer, or exemption issued in terms of Section 42 of the Affirmative Action Act, 1998

Ismsan Investments cc JV Mr T and Miss T Investment cc	<i>As indicated in table above</i>	No	JV agreement between the two companies is not signed
RCC Projects Pty(Ltd)	<i>As indicated in table above</i>	No	Company ownership details not complete, no ownership details
Lee Roadworks and Trading	<i>As indicated in table above</i>	No	Bidder has not submitted original copies of Good standing for both Social Security and Inland Revenue
//Gowases Trading Enterprises cc	<i>As indicated in table above</i>	No	New company, no relevant experience and No Cv's attached for proposed personnel(Site agent and foreman)
D.P.D Civil and Road Maintenance cc	<i>As indicated in table above</i>	No	No relevant experience and No Cv's attached for proposed personnel(Site agent and foreman)
F. A Developers	<i>As indicated in table above</i>	No	No Cv's attached for proposed personnel(Site agent and foreman)
Donn Y Investments cc	<i>As indicated in table above</i>	No	No experience references and no Cv's attached for proposed personnel( foreman)
Menell Investments cc	<i>As indicated in table above</i>	No	No experience and No supporting documents to proof plant availability
Rika's Trading enterprises cc	<i>As indicated in table above</i>	No	No Cv's attached for proposed personnel(Site agent )
Earth Ethicks cc	<i>As indicated in table above</i>	No	No Cv's attached for proposed personnel(Site agent ) and no proof for LDV Bakkie
Makopa Investments	<i>As indicated in table above</i>	No	No Cv's attached for proposed personnel(Site agent ) and no proof for LDV Bakkie
Golden West Investments	<i>As indicated in table above</i>	No	Only one reference for BMU in Khorix for 6months



Mbatjoo Trading Enterprises	<i>As indicated in table above</i>	No	No Cv's attached for proposed personnel(Site agent )
Centurion Investments cc	<i>As indicated in table above</i>	No	No Cv's attached for proposed personnel(Site agent ) and no proof for LDV Bakkie
Jorome Trading Enterprises	<i>As indicated in table above</i>	No	No relevant experience
Queen Mwetako Investments cc	<i>As indicated in table above</i>	No	No supporting documents to proof plant availability
Inek Investments cc	<i>As indicated in table above</i>	No	No supporting documents to proof plant availability and no Cv's attached for proposed personnel(Site agent and foreman)
Sumseno Contracting	<i>As indicated in table above</i>	No	No supporting document for mixer and small plant and no experience references and no Cv's attached for proposed personnel( foreman)
Flexus Investments cc	<i>As indicated in table above</i>	No	No supporting documents to proof plant availability
Pefimbo Renovations & Auctioneering Services	<i>As indicated in table above</i>	No	No proof for Water trailer/compacter, mixer and small tools
Buchter Bricks and Blocks	<i>As indicated in table above</i>	No	No supporting document for mixer and small plant and no experience references and no Cv's attached for proposed personnel( Site agent and foreman)
Extreme Road Construction	<i>As indicated in table above</i>	No	No supporting documents to proof plant availability
Southern Cross Business Enterprises cc	<i>As indicated in table above</i>	No	Financial Income for past 2 years is less than 1.5million

Colonel Investment cc	<i>As indicated in table above</i>	No	No financial Statements submitted and no proof of construction financial income of 1.5mill turnover for past two years
Goreseb Trading cc	<i>As indicated in table above</i>	No	No financial Statements submitted and no proof of construction financial income of 1.5mill turnover for past two years
Alnaa Capital Investments	<i>As indicated in table above</i>	No	Financial Income for past 2 years is less than 1.5million
Dinaledi Investments	<i>As indicated in table above</i>	No	Bid prices did not comply with ITB 33.4

## 8. Price comparison for bids that are substantially responsive:

### **BMU-KHP 03**

Name	A. Price at Bid Opening N\$	B. Bid Price after corrections	C. price after Adjustments N\$	D. Price after Margin of Preference [If applicable]	Rank
Hibachi Investments Holdings Pty(Ltd)	12,517,849.57	12,517,849.57	12,517,849.57	N/A	1
Nilotse Investments cc	12,801,780.91	12,801,780.91	12,801,780.91	N/A	2
Pelico Engineering Group cc	12,329,018.58	12,329,018.58	12,329,018.58	N/A	3
Kauna Builders cc	13,584,042.88	13,584,042.88	13,584,042.88	N/A	4
Brumar Construction cc	13,657,037.96	13,657,037.96	13,657,037.96	N/A	5

### **BMU-KHP 04**

Name	A. Price at Bid Opening N\$	B. Bid Price after corrections	C. price after Adjustments N\$	D. Price after Margin of Preference [If applicable]	Rank
Nilotse Investments cc	11,142,040.65	11,142,040.65	11,142,040.65	N/A	1
Hibachi Investments Holdings Pty(Ltd)	12,185,259.49	12,185,259.49	12,185,259.49	N/A	2
Odjove Trading and Construction cc	10,702,857.65	10,702,857.65	10,702,857.65	N/A	3
Tuckers Builders & Civil Works	10,729,030.98	10,729,030.98	10,729,030.98	N/A	4
Kauna Builders cc	12,299,750.25	12,299,750.25	12,299,750.25	N/A	5
Pelico Engineering Group cc	11,279,150.09	11,279,150.09	11,279,150.09	N/A	6
Brumar Construction cc	13,313,817.93	13,313,817.93	13,313,817.93	N/A	7

### **BMU-KHP 05**

Name	A. Price at Bid Opening N\$	B. Bid Price after corrections	C. price after Adjustments N\$	D. Price after Margin of Preference [If applicable]	Rank
Nilotse Investments cc	12,380,930.36	12,380,930.36	12,380,930.36	N/A	1
Hibachi Investments Holdings Pty(Ltd)	13,259,569.95	13,259,569.95	13,259,569.95	N/A	2
Alugodhi construction and Renovation cc	11,946,070.45	11,946,070.45	11,946,070.45	N/A	3
Odjove Trading and Construction cc	12,714,441.81	12,714,441.81	12,714,441.81	N/A	4
Tuckers Builders & Civil Works	12,614,961.50	12,614,961.50	12,614,961.50	N/A	5

Kauna Builders cc	14,244,756.75	14,244,756.75	14,244,756.75	N/A	6
Pelico Engineering Group cc	13,927,067.64	13,927,067.64	13,927,067.64	N/A	7
Potenza Investments cc	15,617,650.58	15,617,650.58	15,617,650.58	N/A	8
Brumar Construction cc	15,008,572.31	15,008,572.31	15,008,572.31	N/A	9

### **BMU-KHP 06**

Name	A. Price at Bid Opening N\$	B. Bid Price after corrections	C. price after Adjustments N\$	D. Price after Margin of Preference [If applicable]	Rank
Nilotse Investments cc	11,232,753.20	11,232,753.20	11,232,753.20	N/A	1
Hibachi Investments Holdings Pty(Ltd)	11,482,694.00	11,482,694.00	11,482,694.00	N/A	2
Alugodhi construction and Renovation cc	11,158,215.37	11,158,215.37	11,158,215.37	N/A	3
Odjove Trading and Construction cc	11,140,022.91	11,140,022.91	11,140,022.91	N/A	4
Tuckers Builders & Civil Works	11,197,118.18	11,197,118.18	11,197,118.18	N/A	5
Kauna Builders cc	11,696,608.13	11,696,608.13	11,696,608.13	N/A	6
Pelico Engineering Group cc	12,957,820.50	12,957,820.50	12,957,820.50	N/A	7
Potenza Investments cc	14,340,619.86	14,340,619.86	14,340,619.86	N/A	8
Brumar Construction cc	13,663,323.88	13,663,323.88	13,663,323.88	N/A	9

### **BMU-KHP 07**

Name	A. Price at Bid Opening N\$	B. Bid Price after corrections	C. price after Adjustments N\$	D. Price after Margin of Preference [If applicable]	Rank
Hibachi Investments Holdings Pty(Ltd)	12,151,480.04	12,151,480.04	12,151,480.04	N/A	1
Nilotse Investments cc	11,987,951.44	11,987,951.44	11,987,951.44	N/A	2
Alugodhi construction and Renovation cc	11,573,883.48	11,573,883.48	11,573,883.48	N/A	3
Odjove Trading and Construction cc	11,694,848.67	11,694,848.67	11,694,848.67	N/A	4
Pelico Engineering Group cc	11,497,022.65	11,497,022.65	11,497,022.65	N/A	5
Tuckers Builders & Civil Works	12,242,580.29	12,242,580.29	12,242,580.29	N/A	6
Kauna Builders cc	13,520,877.75	13,520,877.75	13,520,877.75	N/A	7
Potenza Investments cc	14,695,701.97	14,695,701.97	14,695,701.97	N/A	8

Brumar Construction cc	14,149,750.62	14,149,750.62	14,149,750.62	N/A	9
------------------------	---------------	---------------	---------------	-----	---

### **BMU-KHP 08**

Name	A. Price at Bid Opening N\$	B. Bid Price after corrections	C. price after Adjustments N\$	D. Price after Margin of Preference [If applicable]	Rank
N R K Technical Services cc	9,904,343.95	9,904,343.95	9,904,343.95	N/A	1
Hibachi Investments Holdings Pty(Ltd)	10,720,769.00	10,720,769.00	10,720,769.00	N/A	2
Niilotse Investments cc	10,895,366.28	10,895,366.28	10,895,366.28	N/A	3
Alugodhi construction and Renovation cc	10,537,907.41	10,537,907.41	10,537,907.41	N/A	4
Tuckers Builders & Civil Works	11,106,284.68	11,106,284.68	11,106,284.68	N/A	5
Kauna Builders cc	12,149,123.25	12,149,123.25	12,149,123.25	N/A	6
Pelico Engineering Group cc	11,681,720.42	11,681,720.42	11,681,720.42	N/A	7
Potenza Investments cc	14,093,625.85	14,093,625.85	14,093,625.85	N/A	8
Brumar Construction cc	13,529,130.40	13,529,130.40	13,529,130.40	N/A	9

### **BMU-KHP 09**

Name	A. Price at Bid Opening N\$	B. Bid Price after corrections	C. price after Adjustments N\$	D. Price after Margin of Preference [If applicable]	Rank
N R K Technical Services cc	11,030,928.80	11,030,928.80	11,030,928.80	N/A	1
Niilotse Investments cc	11,764,036.09	11,764,036.09	11,764,036.09	N/A	2
Odjove Trading and Construction cc	11,577,540.52	11,577,540.52	11,577,540.52	N/A	3
Alugodhi construction and Renovation cc	11,821,626.33	11,821,626.33	11,821,626.33	N/A	4
Pelico Engineering Group cc	11,574,218.30	11,574,218.30	11,574,218.30	N/A	5
Tuckers Builders & Civil Works	12,450,723.91	12,450,723.91	12,450,723.91	N/A	6
Kauna Builders cc	13,607,472.75	13,607,472.75	13,607,472.75	N/A	7
Potenza Investments cc	15,307,637.78	15,307,637.78	15,307,637.78	N/A	8
Brumar Construction cc	14,466,025.06	14,466,025.06	14,466,025.06	N/A	9

**BMU-KHP 10**

Name	A. Price at Bid Opening N\$	B. Bid Price after corrections	C. price after Adjustments N\$	D. Price after Margin of Preference [If applicable]	Rank
N R K Technical Services cc	9,703,889.75	9,703,889.75	9,703,889.75	N/A	1
Nilotse Investments cc	10,405,287.80	10,405,287.80	10,405,287.80	N/A	2
Alugodhi construction and Renovation cc	10,404,381.57	10,404,381.57	10,404,381.57	N/A	3
Pelico Engineering Group cc	10,446,611.35	10,446,611.35	10,446,611.35	N/A	4
Hibachi Investments Holdings Pty(Ltd)	13,085,381.26	13,085,381.26	13,085,381.26	N/A	5
Odjove Trading and Construction cc	11,253,603.08	11,253,603.08	11,253,603.08	N/A	6
Tuckers Builders & Civil Works	10,972,481.59	10,972,481.59	10,972,481.59	N/A	7
Kauna Builders cc	11,908,520.25	11,908,520.25	11,908,520.25	N/A	8
Potenza Investments cc	13,669,836.08	13,669,836.08	13,669,836.08	N/A	9
Brumar Construction cc	12,442,387.29	12,442,387.29	12,442,387.29	N/A	10

**9. Best Evaluated Bid's:**

BMU Area	Recommended Contractor	Bid Submission No	Contract Price (N\$)
BMU-KHP 03	Brumar Construction cc	26	13,657,037.96
BMU-KHP 04	Odjove Trading and Construction cc	31	10,702,857.65
BMU-KHP 05	Nilotse Investments cc	23	12,380,930.36
BMU-KHP 06	Pelico Engineering Group cc	12	11,696,608.13
BMU-KHP 07	Alugodhi construction and Renovation cc	38	11,573,883.48
BMU-KHP 08	N R K Technical Services cc	9	9,904,343.95
BMU-KHP 09	Tuckers Builders & Civil Works	20	11,574,218.30
BMU-KHP 10	Potenza Investments cc	1	13,669,836.08



**CONRAD M LUTOMBI**  
**CHIEF EXECUTIVE OFFICER**

**CHIEF EXECUTIVE OFFICER**



SAFE ROADS TO PROSPERITY

**2018 -09- 05**

Private Bag 12030  
Ausspannplatz, Namibia  
Tel: +264-61-2847074 • Fax: +264-61-2847147  
[www.ra.org.na](http://www.ra.org.na)