

Safe Roads to Prosperity

## Executive Summary of Bid Evaluation Report MAINTENANCE OF BITUMEN ROADS IN THE WINDHOEK REGION

Reference Number: W/ONB/RA-05/2017 - WHK

### 1. Scope of Contract:

The Works are **Routine Maintenance on Bitumen Roads in the Windhoek Region**, with the reference number **W/ONB/RA-05/2017 – WHK**.

The names and identifications of the Contract Areas included in this document are as listed below:

LIST OF CONTRACT AREAS			
NO	CONTRACT AREA	REGION	AREA
1	BMU-WHK 01	Windhoek	Gobabis
2	BMU-WHK 02	Windhoek	Gobabis
3	BMU-WHK 03	Windhoek	Gobabis
4	BMU-WHK 04	Windhoek	Windhoek
5	BMU-WHK 05	Windhoek	Windhoek
6	BMU-WHK 06	Windhoek	Okahandja
7	BMU-WHK 07	Windhoek	Maltahohe

Each Contract Area is regarded as a separate Contract and will be awarded separately. Bidders may submit bids for any number of Contract Areas.

### 2. Procurement method used:

Open National Bidding

### 3. Date of Invitation of Bids

08 December 2017

**4. Closing date for submission of bids**

14 February 2018 at 10H00

**5. Date and place of opening of bids**

14 February 2018 at 10H00. Bids were submitted in the tender box located at the Roads Authority head office, Corner Mandume Ndemufayo Avenue & David Hosea Meroro Road, Southern Industrial Area, Windhoek.

**6. Number of bids received by closing date:**

A total of 87 bids were received.

## 7. Responsiveness of bids:

No. of Bidder's Offer	Bidder's Name	WINDHOEK REGION BMU BID AMOUNTS (N\$)							Responsive or not responsive (YES / NO)
		01-GOBABIS	02-GOBABIS	03-GOBABIS	04-WINDHOEK	05-WINDHOEK	06-OKAHANDJA	07-MALTAHOHE	
1	ALH Construction CC	10,228,644.70	10,208,617.47	10,782,904.13	108,233,351.35	10,214,330.21	10,236,965.78	9,655,721.16	NO
2	Monarch Construction CC	-	-	-	-	-	-	5,625,448.10	NO
3	Ndjamo Duilders CC	10,530,256.75	10,367,681.25	11,592,299.00	9,960,414.50	9,292,752.00	9,135,663.25	9,424,572.00	NO
4	Nilotse Investments CC	9,179,972.69	9,295,786.38	9,531,289.70	9,363,838.20	8,857,167.75	8,999,910.35	8,746,558.16	YES
5	Ju-Jose Investment CC	35,398,950.00	29,478,100.00	47,158,500.00	60,985,750.00	54,976,950.00	38,717,600.00	32,205,950.00	NO
6	Alugodhi Construction and Renovations CC	8,893,564.10	9,017,633.69	9,241,292.59	9,416,914.07	8,872,036.10	9,009,419.82	8,655,171.50	NO
7	Magnetize Investment CC	8,535,017.56	8,528,047.70	9,022,525.27	8,950,392.21	8,215,943.10	8,257,734.45	8,264,081.59	NO
8	Platform Trading (Pty) Ltd	13,435,655.00	13,290,895.00	12,914,040.00	14,292,200.00	13,745,950.00	15,185,145.00	11,724,537.50	NO
9	Odjove Trading and Construction CC	8,930,035.06	8,918,613.17	9,179,595.78	9,912,468.36	9,427,628.82	9,615,910.27	8,877,000.19	YES
10	FA Developers CC	10,357,883.25	10,388,162.75	10,862,051.30	10,550,560.00	9,978,377.50	10,019,478.50	9,737,113.25	NO
11	Chobezi Trading Enterprises CC	8,403,996.89	8,458,805.29	8,640,640.30	8,908,851.58	8,547,120.69	8,832,298.15	8,434,888.74	NO

12	Kunene River Construction CC	7,853,921.61	8,452,551.12	8,500,452.07	8,748,395.70	8,017,258.75	8,329,011.22	8,517,444.47	NO
13	Goreseb Trading CC	8,155,796.61	8,234,051.12	8,923,077.70	9,207,145.70	8,242,258.75	8,587,761.22	8,517,444.47	NO
14	Golden West Investment CC	7,853,921.61	8,452,551.12	8,500,452.07	8,948,395.70	8,017,258.75	8,329,011.21	8,517,444.47	YES
15	Wandeuya Investment CC	9,072,233.02	8,964,220.10	9,102,865.48	9,351,435.45	8,664,192.92	8,900,063.79	8,551,511.37	NO
16	Dinaledi Investments CC	10,668,026.18	10,640,559.00	10,865,511.50	9,410,149.50	9,216,346.79	9,242,775.63	9,022,882.12	YES
17	Globex Investment CC	8,741,152.88	8,859,242.35	9,226,232.08	9,494,874.55	8,824,084.55	9,080,407.20	8,682,263.68	NO
18	Rhitunga Trading Enterprise CC	9,621,595.31	9,743,898.42	9,985,958.93	10,757,979.46	9,989,885.49	10,497,051.13	9,495,675.18	NO
19	WT Business Group CC	6,525,617.50	6,606,870.50	6,635,672.50	7,261,100.00	6,107,075.00	6,148,417.50	6,087,535.00	NO
20	Ovakuatjivi Enterprises CC	9,563,244.75	9,710,007.75	10,278,027.25	9,997,552.25	9,438,239.75	9,498,499.75	9,266,487.25	NO
21	Caslano Investments CC	87,111,588.93	8,849,737.20	9,029,767.86	9,499,160.83	8,892,644.73	9,168,545.83	8,622,837.08	NO
22	Efindano Maintenance and Construction Services CC	16,250,011.75	14,800,925.50	23,666,465.25	9,102,788.00	14,012,106.00	11,958,004.75	14,602,389.50	NO
23	Twalonga Pro-Construct CC	8,712,790.08	8,856,135.63	9,025,489.48	9,527,536.10	8,961,485.40	9,082,020.93	8,571,748.10	NO
24	Geronny Investment CC	7,370,041.00	7,466,111.08	9,019,014.43	8,232,182.43	7,571,492.48	7,476,715.80	762,952.08	NO
25	Centurion Investment (Pty) Ltd	9,051,196.51	9,045,831.21	9,542,801.87	9,636,939.14	9,122,577.38	9,127,218.66	8,598,885.14	NO

26	Earth Ethix CC	10,185,418.93	9,415,763.40	10,733,966.31	9,888,499.19	10,130,870.55	9,359,615.80	9,570,608.39	NO
27	Amarising Services and Technology CC	8,403,996.89	8,458,805.29	8,640,640.30	8,908,851.58	8,547,120.69	8,832,298.15	8,434,888.74	NO
28	John Namusheshe Construction & Investments CC	8,725,146.51	8,752,294.36	9,220,972.84	9,311,939.56	8,635,924.25	8,731,396.68	8,564,695.85	NO
29	Mafukutu Investment CC	7,891,563.00	7,971,450.00	8,636,179.00	8,218,692.85	7,103,713.00	7,549,323.90	7,959,159.00	NO
30	Kizo Investment CC	16,347,677.80	17,317,058.80	18,567,606.75	21,348,901.30	19,942,767.55	19,307,290.20	17,066,773.95	NO
31	Ronam Investment CC	9,114,445.75	9,107,108.75	9,574,440.00	9,834,445.00	9,326,040.00	9,601,206.25	9,085,057.50	NO
32	Infinty Engineering and Project Consultants CC	7,995,134.65	7,750,557.25	10,233,488.33	7,527,564.20	7,027,230.25	6,814,077.66	-	NO
33	Jan Andre investments CC	9,014,424.50	9,016,862.50	9,470,940.00	9,446,387.50	9,121,363.00	9,361,862.50	9,060,965.00	NO
34	Zero Six Five Trading CC	9,399,157.00	10,027,022.50	12,578,347.47	11,700,043.55	11,101,612.07	10,844,736.10	11,013,352.80	YES
35	Khankan Trading Enterprises CC	10,061,020.25	10,074,362.25	10,680,550.25	10,488,212.75	9,898,377.75	9,979,222.75	9,450,970.00	NO
36	Eli Investment Five CC	9,839,984.09	9,966,769.40	10,185,463.75	10,413,194.90	9,942,988.55	10,160,338.55	9,654,292.55	NO
37	Obrien and Fortune Investment CC	8,488,402.48	8,599,598.86	8,837,847.23	9,022,859.81	8,506,637.46	8,738,431.46	8,364,924.11	NO
38	Ronaldt investment CC	9,408,738.80	9,446,560.00	9,990,970.00	9,441,097.50	9,323,751.50	9,550,267.00	8,756,882.00	NO

39	Brumar Construction CC	11,232,179.57	11,224,786.54	11,466,388.78	11,992,602.67	11,209,134.35	11,465,010.00	10,930,947.86	YES
40	Hilger Investment CC	8,525,875.52	8,548,240.72	9,019,865.38	9,115,257.88	8,431,042.38	8,526,030.20	8,352,422.29	NO
41	Ombuka Enterprises CC	10,514,389.34	10,546,381.50	10,743,576.48	10,998,014.24	10,494,421.05	10,691,973.45	10,276,694.42	NO
42	Metanga Investment CC	9,466,202.00	9,263,767.50	10,526,007.50	9,065,795.00	9,022,267.50	9,008,985.00	9,211,040.00	NO
43	Damaseb Construction and Building CC	15,817,617.50	14,532,147.50	25,618,032.50	16,150,082.50	13,261,282.50	12,942,847.00	14,111,075.00	NO
44	D-Square Trading Enterprises CC	8,185,901.25	8,198,746.75	8,540,613.00	8,821,443.00	8,180,605.50	8,257,454.20	8,147,652.25	NO
45	D. P. D Civils & Road Maintenance CC	6,368,539.00	8,309,900.00	7,377,882.00	8,147,807.50	7,753,127.50	7,795,677.50	7,823,162.50	NO
46	RCC Projects (PTY) LTD.	8,389,681.27	8,533,031.98	8,996,778.34	9,324,091.45	8,731,416.87	8,765,017.20	8,326,404.87	NO
47	KPM Trading CC	8,999,747.17	9,004,897.33	9,397,062.85	9,636,062.75	9,203,447.70	9,436,716.58	8,926,760.58	NO
48	Ebdina Trading CC	9,976,192.50	10,022,411.00	10,363,213.50	10,487,988.50	9,888,938.50	10,094,084.75	9,686,266.00	YES
49	Onambula Investment Group CC	8,481,209.75	8,496,286.25	8,968,597.00	9,022,687.25	8,370,924.75	8,461,941.50	8,287,486.50	NO
50	Ditshetlo Investments CC	7,980,641.20	8,051,794.00	8,694,299.00	8,535,898.00	7,857,156.50	8,182,370.75	8,788,300.00	NO
51	Multi Solutions CC and Elecon Construction CC JV	8,745,429.08	8,787,610.58	9,804,444.14	9,037,316.52	8,833,729.37	8,754,351.20	8,145,607.32	NO
52	Insomnia Investments CC	9,311,154.34	9,357,822.21	10,017,175.05	10,405,748.13	9,502,338.40	10,006,099.44	9,350,464.85	NO

53	Kanduu Designing & Construction CC	8,695,628.10	8,820,435.40	9,018,689.40	9,289,333.00	8,823,706.20	9,012,614.20	8,575,447.01	NO
54	Moza Investments CC	9,974,819.98	10,105,933.78	10,352,651.33	10,615,033.03	10,075,579.53	10,284,072.23	9,798,328.90	YES
55	Rouwans Investment CC	94,100,680.00	9,203,680.00	7,811,204.00	9,632,285.00	9,267,275.00	9,499,736.00	8,591,995.00	NO
56	FLD Trading Enterprises CC	8,998,868.45	8,966,210.75	9,561,171.30	9,636,735.50	9,409,980.80	9,647,892.80	9,196,302.75	NO
57	P. T. Puye Trading CC	9,219,550.00	12,854,599.50	10,036,268.50	9,770,480.50	9,269,874.00	9,393,493.25	8,937,271.00	NO
58	Best in Best Investments CC	11,721,127.75	10,873,623.75	18,217,351.25	15,328,551.25	11,789,771.25	9,987,318.50	11,420,247.50	NO
59	Doema Investment CC	9,311,908.80	10,327,563.50	9,120,707.50	9,432,041.25	-	9,209,872.75	8,766,881.25	NO
60	Inek Investments CC	11,538,775.26	8,687,003.11	9,148,407.84	9,231,870.81	8,555,855.50	8,668,031.68	8,422,785.84	NO
61	Almo Trading CC	9,034,916.64	9,201,734.49	9,396,836.59	9,774,169.99	-	-	-	NO
62	Xaba Xaba Trading Enterprises CC	7,465,197.92	7,525,186.73	7,686,609.33	7,746,827.46	7,604,067.53	7,858,383.33	7,503,972.68	NO
63	Kaek Investments CC	9,892,748.50	8,761,217.50	12,115,595.00	12,820,832.50	11,162,187.50	11,459,175.00	13,344,600.00	NO
64	Tossendi Investments CC	11,202,557.11	10,455,995.57	10,604,300.75	11,108,329.19	10,375,210.94	10,429,264.01	9,771,316.50	NO
65	Pefimbo Renovation and Auctioneering Services CC	18,814,143.75	6,858,634.50	7,352,927.50	7,791,135.00	7,280,190.00	7,565,246.25	7,378,601.25	NO
66	Hoeb Investments CC	16,780,702.25	14,963,920.75	-	14,813,753.75	16,364,764.50	12,692,969.75	12,943,249.43	NO

67	Pelico Engineering Group CC	8,463,416.69	8,042,021.24	8,990,379.44	8,933,261.12	8,418,188.03	8,313,396.00	8,252,021.15	YES
68	Eastern Star Construction CC	8,149,990.36	7,823,618.00	7,395,041.36	7,988,362.77	6,191,535.72	80,262,541.26	7,429,517.04	NO
69	Nessipark Invesments CC	9,575,935.00	9,738,775.00	10,034,210.00	10,477,075.00	9,801,450.00	9,960,437.50	9,574,325.00	NO
70	Shapwa Engineering CC	9,174,284.15	9,223,449.39	9,604,100.57	9,493,673.43	8,912,820.85	9,667,144.76	8,878,523.83	NO
71	Hibachi Investments Holdings Pty(Ltd)	11,064,109.51	10,696,609.43	12,199,032.68	10,755,576.14	11,596,187.50	10,132,480.95	10,495,486.79	YES
72	E/B Trading Enterprises CC	7,877,708.00	5,861,371.75	7,821,786.45	7,685,403.75	6,948,691.75	6,024,455.55	6,018,778.00	NO
73	CAG Trading Enterprises CC	9,471,859.71	9,940,009.76	10,029,402.71	9,919,632.34	9,515,717.84	9,739,818.34	9,158,234.59	NO
74	Queen Mwetako	-	-	-		8,724,468.39	8,497,095.22	8,624,916.57	NO
75	Pisces Investment Holdings Number Eight CC	8,531,981.27	8,584,764.03	8,539,579.29	9,158,519.79	8,372,459.03	8,863,763.38	7,951,283.48	YES
76	Shatty Construction cc	9,365,573.55	9,369,211.00	9,848,456.25	10,150,733.75	9,478,056.75	9,864,585.00	9,359,361.21	NO
77	Potenza Investment CC	108,924,042.45	108,976,608.60	109,227,054.41	110,166,276.54	109,539,039.80	109,807,659.38	109,881,073.00	NO
78	Ndinependa Trading Enterprises CC	10,347,778.20	7,359,535.40	11,750,552.80	10,047,586.23	9,306,735.61	9,536,603.28	8,740,723.36	YES
79	Baobab Trading Enterprises CC	8,438,033.58	9,774,649.25	9,988,952.90	-	-	9,470,860.65	10,526,965.38	NO
80	Dotas Trading CC	8,525,875.52	13,869,020.47	9,019,865.38	9,115,257.88	8,438,931.38	8,526,030.20	8,352,422.29	NO



81	Florida Trading CC	6,301,922.35	7,780,530.52	7,313,659.49	8,155,151.07	7,659,517.62	7,723,809.86	7,612,515.16	YES
82	Kauna Builders CC	10,448,348.00	10,249,754.50	11,334,360.50	9,829,714.13	9,194,241.38	9,060,496.38	6,537,491.25	NO
83	Hui Tani Trading Enterprises CC	7,751,080.50	7,573,520.50	7,508,545.50	7,712,705.00	6,372,955.00	6,364,617.50	6,509,115.00	NO
84	Pandu Construction CC	9,293,213.60	9,288,253.88	9,799,331.13	9,689,777.53	9,087,745.05	9,105,441.25	8,886,275.98	NO
85	Colonel Investment cc	9,863,739.75	10,470,405.00	11,105,676.50	9,886,619.00	9,397,340.00	9,090,278.50	8,961,421.00	NO
86	Albatros Investment (Pty) Ltd	9,341,565.00	8,268,293.00	10,191,645.00	10,388,122.50	9,487,211.50	9,887,861.00	9,206,382.50	NO
87	Sacharia's Civil Project CC	10,523,046.25	10,504,818.75	8,264,705.00	11,101,352.50	10,026,965.00	10,286,433.75	10,159,071.25	NO

The table lists the bids that were not responsive, with the reasons why it is not responsive:

No. of Bidder's Offer	Bidder's Name	Pricing at Bid Opening (N\$)	Responsive or not responsive (Yes/No)	Reasons why bid is not responsive
1	ALH Construction CC	As indicated in table above	NO	No proof of relevant work experience as main contractor and proposed personnel (foreman and site agent) do not meet minimum requirements.
2	Monarch Construction CC	As indicated in table above	NO	Statutory documents not certified.
3	Ndjamo Builders CC	As indicated in table above	NO	Invalid financial statements.
5	Ju-Jose Investment CC	As indicated in table above	NO	No bid security attached.

6	Alugodhi Construction and Renovations CC	As indicated in table above	NO	Foreman do not meet minimum requirements.
7	Magnetize Investment CC	As indicated in table above	NO	No proof of availability for all plant required and proposed personnel (foreman and site agent) do not meet minimum requirements.
8	Platform Trading (Pty) Ltd	As indicated in table above	NO	No bid security attached.
10	FA Developers CC	As indicated in table above	NO	No proof of relevant work experience for last 3 years, no proof of availability for all plant required and required personnel not listed (CVs, but no designations).
11	Chobezi Trading Enterprises CC	As indicated in table above	NO	No bid security attached.
12	Kunene River Construction CC	As indicated in table above	NO	No proof of relevant work experience for last 3 years and foreman do not meet minimum requirements
13	Goreseb Trading CC	As indicated in table above	NO	Foreman and site agent do not meet minimum requirements.
15	Wandeyu Investment CC	As indicated in table above	NO	Invalid bid security attached.
17	Globex Investment CC	As indicated in table above	NO	No proof of required construction income.
18	Rhitunga Trading Enterprise CC	As indicated in table above	NO	Site agent and Foreman do not meet minimum requirements.
19	WT Business Group CC	As indicated in table above	NO	Invalid bid security attached.
20	Ovakuatjivi Enterprises CC	As indicated in table above	NO	No bid security attached.
21	Caslano Investments CC	As indicated in table above	NO	Foreman do not meet minimum requirements.
22	Efindano Maintenance and Construction Services CC	As indicated in table above	NO	Site agent do not meet minimum requirements.
23	Twalonga Pro-Construct CC	As indicated in table above	NO	No proof of relevant work experience for last 3 years as main contractor and gave references for another company.
24	Gerony Investment CC	As indicated in table above	NO	No bid security attached.
25	Centurion Investment (Pty) Ltd	As indicated in table above	NO	Site agent and Foreman do not meet minimum requirements.

26	Earth Ethix CC	As indicated in table above	NO	No proof of availability of required financial resources.
27	Amarising Services and Technology CC	As indicated in table above	NO	No bid security attached.
28	John Namusheshe Construction & Investments CC	As indicated in table above	NO	Invalid bid security attached.
29	Mafukutu Investment CC	As indicated in table above	NO	Offered validity period for the bid NOT in line with ITB Sub-clause 19.
30	Kizo Investment CC	As indicated in table above	NO	No proof of relevant work experience for last 3 years as main contractor, no references and no proof of availability of foreman.
31	Ronam Investment CC	As indicated in table above	NO	Invalid bid security attached.
32	Infinity Engineering and Project Consultants CC	As indicated in table above	NO	Invalid bid security attached.
33	Jan Andre investments CC	As indicated in table above	NO	No proof of required construction financial income and foreman do not meet minimum requirements.
35	Khankan Trading Enterprises CC	As indicated in table above	NO	No proof of financial resources nor construction financial income.
36	Eli Investment Five CC	As indicated in table above	NO	No bid security attached.
37	Obrien and Fortune Investment CC	As indicated in table above	NO	No bid security attached.
38	Ronaldt investment CC	As indicated in table above	NO	No proof of construction financial income and no proof of availability of financial resources.
40	Hilger Investment CC	As indicated in table above	NO	No references provided and no proof of availability of foreman.
41	Ombuka Enterprises CC	As indicated in table above	NO	Invalid bid security attached.
42	Metanga Investment CC	As indicated in table above	NO	No proof of relevant work experience for last 3 years, no proof of availability of site agent and bid document not fully completed.
43	Damaseb Construction and Building CC	As indicated in table above	NO	No affirmative action compliance documents.
44	D-Square Trading Enterprises CC	As indicated in table above	NO	Invalid bid security attached.

45	D. P. D Civils & Road Maintenance CC	As indicated in table above	NO	No proof of relevant work experience, no references.
46	RCC Projects (PTY) LTD.	As indicated in table above	NO	Company registration certificate not complete, no ownership details and labour undertaking not completed.
47	KPM Trading CC	As indicated in table above	NO	No proof of relevant work experience, no proof of availability of foreman and no proof of availability of all plant required.
49	Onambula Investment Group CC	As indicated in table above	NO	No proof of relevant work experience and foreman do not meet minimum requirements.
50	Ditshetlo Investments CC	As indicated in table above	NO	No proof of relevant work experience for last 3 years.
51	Multi Solutions CC and Elecon Construction CC JV	As indicated in table above	NO	No reference for previous works.
52	Insomnia Investments CC	As indicated in table above	NO	No proof of relevant work experience for last 3 years.
53	Kanduu Designing & Construction CC	As indicated in table above	NO	No bid security attached.
55	Rouwans Investment CC	As indicated in table above	NO	Foreman do not meet minimum requirements.
56	FLD Trading Enterprises CC	As indicated in table above	NO	Statutory documents not certified.
57	P. T. Puye Trading CC	As indicated in table above	NO	No proof of relevant work experience, no references and no proof of availability of all plant required.
58	Best in Best Investments CC	As indicated in table above	NO	Invalid bid security attached.
59	Doema Investment CC	As indicated in table above	NO	Invalid bid security attached.
60	Inek Investments CC	As indicated in table above	NO	No proof of relevant experience, no proof of availability of all plant required and no proof of availability of foreman.
61	Almo Trading CC	As indicated in table above	NO	No proof of relevant work experience, no references and no proof of availability of all plant required.
62	Xaba Xaba Trading Enterprises CC	As indicated in table above	NO	No bid security attached.
63	Kaek Investments CC	As indicated in table above	NO	No proof of relevant work experience, no references and no proof of availability of all plant required.
64	Tossendi Investments CC	As indicated in table above	NO	No proof of relevant work experience and no proof of availability of foreman.

65	Pefimbo Renovation and Auctioneering Services CC	As indicated in table above	NO	No proof of relevant work experience, no references. Foreman listed; but no CV attached.
66	Hoeb Investments CC	As indicated in table above	NO	Invalid bid security attached.
68	Eastern Star Construction CC	As indicated in table above	NO	No bid security attached.
69	Nessipark Invesments CC	As indicated in table above	NO	Foreman do not meet minimum requirements.
70	Shapwa Engineering CC	As indicated in table above	NO	No proof of relevant work experience, no proof of availability of all plant required and no proof of availability of foreman.
72	E/B Trading Enterprises CC	As indicated in table above	NO	No bid security attached.
73	CAG Trading Enterprises CC	As indicated in table above	NO	No bid security attached.
74	Queen Mwetako	As indicated in table above	NO	Omitted clauses (c to f) of the Letter of Bid, thus no Bid Validity Period provided/confirmed.
76	Shatty Construction cc	As indicated in table above	NO	No proof of financial resources' availability.
77	Potenza Investment CC	As indicated in table above	NO	All bid amounts above allowable limits from Engineer's estimates.
79	Baobab Trading Enterprises CC	As indicated in table above	NO	No bid security attached.
80	Dotas Trading CC	As indicated in table above	NO	No proof of financial resources' availability.
82	Kauna Builders CC	As indicated in table above	NO	Bill of Quantity not signed.
83	Hui Tani Trading Enterprises CC	As indicated in table above	NO	Letter of Bid not completed, thus no Bid Validity Period provided/ confirmed. No written proof of authorization for person signing bidding document.
84	Pandu Construction CC	As indicated in table above	NO	No bid security attached.
85	Colonel Investment CC	As indicated in table above	NO	No financial statements attached.
86	Albatros Investment (Pty) Ltd	As indicated in table above	NO	No proof of relevant work experience; no references (experience and references for another company).
87	Sacharia's Civil Project CC	As indicated in table above	NO	Insufficient value of contracts completed (N\$ 500K), do not meet minimum requirements for construction financial income.

## 8. Price comparison for bids that are substantially responsive:

### BMU-WHK 01

Bid No.	Bidder's name	A. Price at Bid Opening (N\$)	B. Bid Price after corrections (N\$)	C. Price after Adjustments (N\$)	D. Price after Margin of Preference (If applicable)	Rank
4	Niilotse Investments cc	9,179,972.69	9,179,972.69	9,179,972.69	N/A	1
9	Odjove Trading and Construction CC	8,930,035.06	8,930,035.06	8,930,035.06	N/A	2
67	Pelico Engineering Group cc	8,463,416.69	8,463,416.69	8,463,416.69	N/A	3
75	Pisces Investment Holdings Number Eight cc	8,531,981.27	8,531,981.27	8,531,981.27	N/A	4
34	Zero Six Five Trading CC	9,399,157.00	9,399,157.00	9,399,157.00	N/A	5
54	Moza Investments cc	9,974,819.98	9,974,819.98	9,974,819.98	N/A	6
78	Ndinependa Trading Enterprises CC	10,347,778.20	10,347,778.20	10,347,778.20	N/A	7
39	Brumar Construction cc	11,232,179.57	11,323,179.57	11,323,179.57	N/A	8
71	Hibachi Investments Holdings Pty(Ltd)	11,064,109.51	11,064,109.51	11,064,109.51	N/A	9
48	Ebdina Trading cc	9,976,192.50	9,976,192.50	9,976,192.50	N/A	10
16	Dinaledi Investments cc	10,668,026.18	10,668,026.18	10,668,026.18	N/A	11

### BMU-WHK 02

Bid No.	Bidder's name	A. Price at Bid Opening (N\$)	B. Bid Price after corrections (N\$)	C. Price after Adjustments (N\$)	D. Price after Margin of Preference (If applicable)	Rank
14	Golden West Investment cc	8,452,551.12	8,452,551.12	8,452,551.12	N/A	1
4	Niilotse Investments cc	9,295,786.38	9,295,786.38	9,295,786.38	N/A	2
9	Odjove Trading and Construction CC	8,918,613.17	8,918,613.17	8,918,613.17	N/A	3
67	Pelico Engineering Group cc	8,042,021.24	8,042,021.24	8,042,021.24	N/A	4
75	Pisces Investment Holdings Number Eight cc	8,584,764.03	8,584,769.03	8,584,769.03	N/A	5
71	Hibachi Investments Holdings Pty(Ltd)	10,696,609.43	10,696,609.43	10,696,609.43	N/A	6
39	Brumar Construction cc	11,224,786.54	11,224,786.54	11,224,786.54	N/A	7

54	Moza Investments cc	10,105,933.78	10,105,933.78	10,105,933.78	N/A	8
16	Dinaledi Investments cc	10,640,559.00	10,640,559.00	10,640,559.00	N/A	9
48	Ebdina Trading cc	10,022,411.00	10,022,411.00	10,022,411.00	N/A	10
34	Zero Six Five Trading CC	10,027,022.50	10,027,022.50	10,027,022.50	N/A	11

### BMU-WHK 03

Bid No.	Bidder's name	A. Price at Bid Opening (N\$)	B. Bid Price after corrections (N\$)	C. Price after Adjustments (N\$)	D. Price after Margin of Preference (If applicable)	Rank
4	Niilotse Investments cc	9,531,289.70	9,531,289.70	9,531,289.70	N/A	1
9	Odjove Trading and Construction CC	9,179,595.78	9,179,595.78	9,179,595.78	N/A	2
67	Pelico Engineering Group cc	8,990,379.44	8,990,379.44	8,990,379.44	N/A	3
39	Brumar Construction cc	11,466,388.78	11,466,388.78	11,466,388.78	N/A	4
54	Moza Investments cc	10,352,651.33	10,352,651.33	10,352,651.33	N/A	5
16	Dinaledi Investments cc	10,865,511.50	10,865,511.65	10,865,511.65	N/A	6
48	Ebdina Trading cc	10,363,213.50	10,363,213.50	10,363,213.50	N/A	7
71	Hibachi Investments Holdings Pty(Ltd)	12,199,032.68	12,199,032.68	12,199,032.68	N/A	8
78	Ndinependa Trading Enterprises CC	11,750,552.80	11,750,552.80	11,750,552.80	N/A	9
34	Zero Six Five Trading CC	12,578,347.47	12,578,347.47	12,578,347.47	N/A	10

### BMU-WHK 04

Bid No.	Bidder's name	A. Price at Bid Opening (N\$)	B. Bid Price after corrections (N\$)	C. Price after Adjustments (N\$)	D. Price after Margin of Preference (If applicable)	Rank
4	Niilotse Investments cc	9,363,838.20	9,361,538.20	9,361,538.20	N/A	1
16	Dinaledi Investments cc	9,410,149.50	9,410,149.56	9,410,149.56	N/A	2
9	Odjove Trading and Construction CC	9,912,468.36	9,912,468.36	9,912,468.36	N/A	3
67	Pelico Engineering Group cc	8,933,261.12	8,933,261.12	8,933,261.12	N/A	4
78	Ndinependa Trading Enterprises CC	10,047,586.23	10,047,586.23	10,047,586.23	N/A	5

71	Hibachi Investments Holdings Pty(Ltd)	10,755,576.14	10,755,576.14	10,755,576.14	N/A	6
75	Pisces Investment Holdings Number Eight cc	9,158,519.79	9,158,519.79	9,158,519.79	N/A	7
39	Brumar Construction cc	11,992,602.67	11,992,602.67	11,992,602.67	N/A	8
48	Ebdina Trading cc	10,487,988.50	10,487,988.50	10,487,988.50	N/A	9
54	Moza Investments cc	10,615,033.03	10,615,033.03	10,615,033.03	N/A	10
34	Zero Six Five Trading CC	11,700,043.55	11,700,043.55	11,700,043.55	N/A	11

## BMU-WHK 05

Bid No.	Bidder's name	A. Price at Bid Opening (N\$)	B. Bid Price after corrections (N\$)	C. Price after Adjustments (N\$)	D. Price after Margin of Preference (If applicable)	Rank
4	Niilotse Investments cc	8,857,167.75	8,857,167.75	8,857,167.75	N/A	1
16	Dinaledi Investments cc	9,216,346.79	9,216,346.79	9,216,346.79	N/A	2
9	Odjove Trading and Construction CC	9,427,628.82	9,427,628.82	9,427,628.82	N/A	3
78	Ndinependa Trading Enterprises CC	9,306,735.61	9,306,735.61	9,306,735.61	N/A	4
67	Pelico Engineering Group cc	8,418,188.03	8,418,188.03	8,418,188.03	N/A	5
75	Pisces Investment Holdings Number Eight cc	8,372,459.03	8,375,459.03	8,375,459.03	N/A	6
39	Brumar Construction cc	11,209,134.35	11,209,134.35	11,209,134.35	N/A	7
48	Ebdina Trading cc	9,888,938.50	9,858,938.50	9,858,938.50	N/A	8
71	Hibachi Investments Holdings Pty(Ltd)	11,596,187.50	11,596,187.50	11,596,187.50	N/A	9
54	Moza Investments cc	10,075,579.53	10,075,579.53	10,075,579.53	N/A	10
34	Zero Six Five Trading CC	11,101,612.07	11,101,612.07	11,101,612.07	N/A	11



**BMU-WHK 06**

Bid No.	Bidder's name	A. Price at Bid Opening (N\$)	B. Bid Price after corrections (N\$)	C. Price after Adjustments (N\$)	D. Price after Margin of Preference (If applicable)	Rank
4	Niilotse Investments cc	8,999,910.35	8,999,910.35	8,999,910.35	N/A	1
16	Dinaledi Investments cc	9,242,775.63	9,242,775.63	9,242,775.63	N/A	2
9	Odjove Trading and Construction CC	9,615,910.27	9,615,910.27	9,615,910.27	N/A	3
78	Ndinependa Trading Enterprises CC	9,536,603.28	9,536,603.28	9,536,603.28	N/A	4
71	Hibachi Investments Holdings Pty(Ltd)	10,132,480.95	10,132,480.95	10,132,480.95	N/A	5
75	Pisces Investment Holdings Number Eight cc	8,863,763.38	8,863,746.38	8,863,746.38	N/A	6
39	Brumar Construction cc	11,465,010.00	11,465,010.50	11,465,010.50	N/A	7
54	Moza Investments cc	10,284,072.23	10,284,072.23	10,284,072.23	N/A	8
48	Ebdina Trading cc	10,094,084.75	10,094,084.75	10,094,084.75	N/A	9
34	Zero Six Five Trading CC	10,844,736.10	10,844,736.10	10,844,736.10	N/A	10


**BMU-WHK 07**

Bid No.	Bidder's name	A. Price at Bid Opening (N\$)	B. Bid Price after corrections (N\$)	C. Price after Adjustments (N\$)	D. Price after Margin of Preference (If applicable)	Rank
14	Golden West Investment cc	8,517,444.47	8,071,899.97	8,071,899.97	N/A	1
4	Niilotse Investments cc	8,746,558.16	8,746,615.66	8,746,615.66	N/A	2
81	Florida Trading cc	7,612,515.16	8,161,236.91	8,161,236.91	N/A	3
9	Odjove Trading and Construction CC	8,877,000.19	8,877,000.19	8,877,000.19	N/A	4
78	Ndinependa Trading Enterprises CC	8,740,723.36	8,740,720.36	8,740,720.36	N/A	5
16	Dinaledi Investments cc	9,022,882.12	9,022,882.12	9,022,882.12	N/A	6
67	Pelico Engineering Group cc	8,252,021.15	8,252,621.15	8,252,621.15	N/A	7
71	Hibachi Investments Holdings Pty(Ltd)	10,495,486.79	10,495,486.79	10,495,486.79	N/A	8
39	Brumar Construction cc	10,930,947.86	10,930,947.86	10,930,947.86	N/A	9
54	Moza Investments cc	9,798,328.90	9,798,328.90	9,798,328.90	N/A	10

48	Ebdina Trading cc	9,686,266.00	9,686,266.00	9,686,266.00	N/A	11
34	Zero Six Five Trading CC	11,013,352.80	11,013,352.80	11,013,352.80	N/A	12

## 9. Best Evaluated Bids:

Contract Area	Bid No.	Bidder's Name	Corrected Bid Amount (N\$)
BMU WHK 01	75	Pisces Investment Holdings Number Eight CC	8,531,981.27
BMU WHK 02	14	Golden West Investment CC	8,452,551.12
BMU WHK 03	54	Moza Investments CC	10,352,651.33
BMU WHK 04	16	Dinaledi Investments CC	9,410,149.56
BMU WHK 05	78	Ndinpenda Trading Enterprises CC	9,306,735.61
BMU WHK 06	34	Zero Six Five Trading CC	10,884,736.10
BMU WHK 07	81	Florida Trading CC	8,161,236.91

  
**CONRAD M LUTOMBI**  
**CHIEF EXECUTIVE OFFICER**

**CHIEF EXECUTIVE OFFICER**  
DEPENDABLE TO THE FUTURE  
**2018-09-05**  
 Private Bag 12030  
 Ausspannplatz, Namibia  
 Tel: +264-61-2847071 • Fax: +264-61-2647147  
[www.ra.org.na](http://www.ra.org.na)