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     Safe Roads to Prosperity 

 

Executive Summary of Bid Evaluation Report 

 

Project Title: Concrete and Steel Works in the Windhoek Region  

Reference number of procurement: W/ONB/RA-01/2018 

 

1. Scope of Contract:     

Concrete and Steel Works in the Windhoek Region  

2. Procurement method used:    

Open National Bidding 

3. Date of Invitation of Bids:    

22 March 2018 

4. Closing date for submission of bids:   

19 April 2018 

5. Date and place of opening of bids:   

19 April 2018, Roads Authority Head Office – Windhoek  

6. Number of bids received by closing date:   

25 

7. Responsiveness of bids:     

25 (all responsive) 

 

Bidder’ s Name 
Pricing at Bid 

Opening (N$) 
Reasons why bid is not responsive 

J.J.T. Civil and 

Construction cc 
20,617,154.00 

Only 2 LDV vehicles listed (insufficient essential equipment) 

and no letter for timely acquisition of the essential equipment,  

No CV for the Site foreman. 

MK Capital Investments 

cc 
21,070,474.64 

First page of Bid Submission Sheet Form not filled in,  

Supporting documents bound to bid document (ITB 14.1(i) and 

ITB 14.1(vi)), 
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No period of validity of the bid is filled in the Bid Submission 

Form. 

Hui Tani Trading 

Enterprises cc 
23,973,682.00 No bid amount filled in Bid Submission Sheet Form. 

D.P.D Civil and Road 

Maintenance 
18,171,844.15 

Bid Securing Declaration not filled in, 

No copy of bid submitted (ITB 21.1). 

Onandjila Investment cc 42,453,447.87 

Bid Submission Sheet Form not filled in, 

Form of bid not filled in, 

No copy of bid submitted (ITB 21.1), 

No period of validity of the bid is filled in the Bid Submission 

Form. 

J. Basement Construction 

Trading cc 
22,665,200.50 

No reference letters of successfully completed projects by 

contracting parties, 

Only one 8ton truck listed (insufficient essential equipment) and 

no letter for timely acquisition of the essential equipment, 

No CV for the Site foreman. 

Oshikoto Building 

Construction cc 
17,924,550.90 None. 

Zero Six Five Trading cc 16,804,073.70 No bid amount filled in Bid Submission Sheet Form. 

Amutanga Trading 

Enterprises cc 
23,601,261.40 

Balance-sheet, the profit and loss account or other appropriate 

financial statement not submitted for 2017 (insufficient for 

requirement), 

Proof of construction financial income is N$ 2,8million and not 

a minimum of N$ 5M per year over the last 3 years (insufficient 

for requirement). 

John Namusheshe 

Construction Investment 

cc 

26,949,963.65 Bid Securing Declaration not filled in. 

Monarch Construction cc 23,426,722.91 

No reference letters of successfully completed projects by 

contracting parties, 

No proof of ownership for equipment listed (insufficient for 

requirement). 

Omuinekelwa Trading 

Enterprises cc 
25,585,832.50 

Supporting document not bound together, submitted as loose 

pages (ITB 14.1(vi)). 

Flame Investment cc 29,324,690.30 Bid Securing Declaration not filled in. 

Geckoh Fifty Eight 

Investment cc 
22,612,001.50 None. 

Oshikoto Civils and 

Logistics cc 
19,718,632.55 

Bid Submission Sheet Form not filled in, 

Bid Securing Declaration not filled in, 

No period of validity of the bid is filled in the Bid Submission 

Form. 

Queen Mwetako 

Investments cc 
27,532,550.20 

Bid Submission Sheet Form not filled in, 

Bid Securing Declaration not filled in, 

No period of validity of the bid is filled in the Bid Submission 

Form. 

D-Square Trading 

Enterprises cc 
23,590,048.90 No copy of bid submitted (ITB 21.1). 

Brumar Construction cc 32,466,664.42 No copy of the Affirmative Action Compliance Certificate. 

Danny’s Building 

Construction cc 
24,151,294.90 No bid amount filled in Bid Submission Sheet Form.  
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Bid document altered, supporting document bound onto bid 

document (ITB 14.1(i)). 

Ndjamo Builders cc 24,638,429.15 Price bid higher than price margin. 

Purity Investment cc 22,405,220.74 
Only one reference letter by contracting party for successfully 

completed project (insufficient for requirement). 

Ongoma Trading 

Enterprises cc 
18,855,061.90 

Only one reference letter by contracting party for successfully 

completed project (insufficient for requirement). 

Ndes Conglomerates 

Investment cc 
23,057,626.50 

Bid Submission Sheet Form not filled in, 

Bid Securing Declaration not filled in, 

No period of validity of the bid is filled in the Bid Submission 

Form. 

Kauna Investment cc 23,664,831.10 None. 

Ndinependa Trading 

Enterprises cc 
20,294,858.97 No bid amount filled in Bid Submission Sheet Form. 

 

8.  Price comparison for bids that are substantially responsive: 

Name 
A. Price at Bid 

Opening (N$) 

B. Bid Price after 

corrections (N$) 

C. Price after 

Adjustments (N$) 

Oshikoto Building Construction cc  17,924,550.90 

No Corrections No Adjustments Geckoh Fifty Eight Investments cc  22,612,001.50 

Kauna Investment cc  23,664,831.10 

 

9. Best Evaluated Bid: 

Oshikoto Building Construction cc  N$ 17,924,550.90. 

 

 

 

 


