



Safe Roads to Prosperity

## Executive Summary of Bid Evaluation Report

### ROUTINE MAINTENANCE OF BITUMEN ROADS IN THE OTJIWARONGO REGION

W/ONB/RA-04/2017 - OTJ

#### 1. Scope of Contract:

The *Works* are specified as the Routine Maintenance of Bitumen Roads in the Otjiwarongo Region. The Public Entity is the Roads Authority of Namibia.

The names and identifications of the Contract Areas included in this document are as listed below:

LIST OF CONTRACT AREAS			
No	CONTRACT AREA	REGION	AREA
1	BMU-OTJ 06	Otjiwarongo	Grootfontein
2	BMU-OTJ 08	Otjiwarongo	Grootfontein
3	BMU-OTJ 09	Otjiwarongo	Otjiwarongo
4	BMU-OTJ 11	Otjiwarongo	Outjo
5	BMU-OTJ 01	Otjiwarongo	Usakos
6	BMU-OTJ 14	Otjiwarongo	Usakos
7	BMU-OTJ 15	Otjiwarongo	Usakos
8	BMU-OTJ 02	Otjiwarongo	Usakos

Each Contract Area is regarded as a separate Contract and will be awarded separately.

Bidders may submit bids for any number of Contract Areas. The Roads Authority reserves the right to award different Contract Areas to different Bidders or to award more than one Contract Area to the same Bidder.

2. **Procurement method used:** Open National Bidding
3. **Date of Invitation of Bids:** 14 December 2017
4. **Closing date for submission of bids:** 14 February 2018
5. **Date and place of opening of bids:** 14 February 2018
6. **Number of bids received by closing date:** 91
7. **Responsiveness of bids:** 33

Bidder' s Name	Pricing at Bid Opening N\$	Responsive or not responsive (Yes/ No)	Reasons why bid is not responsive
1. Dinaledi Investment cc	0 - (OTJ-06) 0 - (OTJ-08) 8,608,509.86 - (OTJ-09) 0 - (OTJ-11) 8,872,447.00 - (OTJ-01) 9,680,707.88 - (OTJ-14) 10,523,289.66 - (OTJ-15) 10,857,038.85 - (OTJ-02)	Yes	
2. Nirwana Trading Enterprises cc	8,380,967.99 - (OTJ-06) 8,370,057.94 - (OTJ-08) 7,424,111.35 - (OTJ-09) 7,700,189.21 - (OTJ-11) 7,781,722.25 - (OTJ-01) 8,136,450.10 - (OTJ-14) 8,944,955.35 - (OTJ-15) 9,415,618.10 - (OTJ-02)	Yes	
3. Omaruru Small Miners cc	9,686,254.50 - (OTJ-06) 9,577,016.00 - (OTJ-08) 7,870,611.50 - (OTJ-09) 8,926,886.50 - (OTJ-11) 8,861,273.25 - (OTJ-01) 8,747,314.00 - (OTJ-14) 9,295,059.00 - (OTJ-15)	No	No Proposals for the timely acquisition of (own, lease or hire) of the essential equipment (Section IV: Bidding Forms: Part E: Technical Proposal) Refer to clause 6.3(c); Bidder has not submitted proof of availability of relevant qualified personnel.

	9,770,975.00 - (OTJ-02)		
4. Golden West Investment	8,595,331.93 - (OTJ-06) 8,595,519.68 - (OTJ-08) 7,063,510.50 - (OTJ-09) 8,162,485.96 - (OTJ-11) 7,522,092.09 - (OTJ-01) 7,875,290.03 - (OTJ-14) 8,413,676.66 - (OTJ-15) 8,849,710.92 - (OTJ-02)	No	No <i>Bid Security</i> attached
5. Pisces Investment Holdings Number Eight cc	8,903,052.54 - (OTJ-06) 8,849,482.31 - (OTJ-08) 7,737,257.64 - (OTJ-09) 8,150,321.07 - (OTJ-11) 8,591,182.89 - (OTJ-01) 8,945,249.42 - (OTJ-14) 9,909,385.15 - (OTJ-15) 10,684,072.24 - (OTJ-02)	Yes	
6. Kanduu Designing & Construction cc	8,548,329.36 - (OTJ-06) 8,528,343.20 - (OTJ-08) 7,732,910.10 - (OTJ-09) 8,099,269.17 - (OTJ-11) 7,865,701.93 - (OTJ-01) 8,771,304.74 - (OTJ-14) 9,119,420.87 - (OTJ-15) 9,559,265.38 - (OTJ-02)	No	No <i>Bid Security</i> attached
7. D. P. D Civils & Road Maintenance	8,639,674.00 - (OTJ-06) 4,285,319.75 - (OTJ-08) 9,029,943.75 - (OTJ-09) 5,273,210.00 - (OTJ-11) 7,575,251.25 - (OTJ-01) 4,873,355.00 - (OTJ-14) 7,952,422.50 - (OTJ-15) 8,172,578.50 - (OTJ-02)	No	Bidder does not have a valid certified copy of Affirmative Action Compliance Certificate, proof from Employment Equity Commissioner that bidder is not a relevant employer, or exemption issued in terms of Section 42 of the Affirmative Action Act, 1998 (EXPIRED).
8. Shatty Construction cc	10,260,741.03 - (OTJ-06) 10,176,458.68 - (OTJ-08) 8,511,855.53 - (OTJ-09) 9,512,116.90 - (OTJ-11) 9,205,460.78 - (OTJ-01) 9,313,046.15 - (OTJ-14)	Yes	

	9,970,948.50 - (OTJ-15) 10,434,022.45 - (OTJ-02)		
9. Bonsikie Investment cc	15,465,838.25 - (OTJ-06) 27,419,731.75 - (OTJ-08) 7,667,970.00 - (OTJ-09) 7,992,672.50 - (OTJ-11) 13,149,905.00 - (OTJ-01) 10,570,598.75 - (OTJ-14) 18,383,066.25 - (OTJ-15) 37,094,566.75 - (OTJ-02)	No	No <i>Bid Security</i> attached
10. Potenza Investments cc	11,449,981.01 - (OTJ-06) 11,211,360.45 - (OTJ-08) 9,750,447.24 - (OTJ-09) 10,566,102.78 - (OTJ-11) 10,301,410.34 - (OTJ-01) 10,983,886.06 - (OTJ-14) 11,584,252.86 - (OTJ-15) 12,121,945.14 - (OTJ-02)	Yes	
11. Pefimbo Renovation and Auctioneering Services cc	8,318,473.25 - (OTJ-06) 8,275,871.50 - (OTJ-08) 6,915,283.50 - (OTJ-09) 7,963,692.50 - (OTJ-11) 7,531,350.00 - (OTJ-01) 7,979,620.00 - (OTJ-14) 9,040,610.00 - (OTJ-15) 9,345,590.00 - (OTJ-02)	No	Bidder has not submitted signed and dated balance-sheet, the profit and loss account or other appropriate financial statement as per the Bidder's Qualification Forms: Part F and ITB 6.2 (f) Bidder has not submitted proof of construction financial income of a minimum of N\$ 1.5M per year over the last 2 years. (Refer to clauses 6.2 (f) and 6.3 (a)) Bidder has not submitted proof of availability of Financial Resources issued by the bank or other financial institution (Minimum = N\$ 500 000 to qualify for award of a BMU). Refer to clause 6.3 (e) and Form FIN 3.3.
12. Baubab Trading Enterprise cc	11,140,175.93 - (OTJ-06) 12,030,805.50 - (OTJ-08) 8,521,425.31 - (OTJ-09) 10,205,331.27 - (OTJ-11)	No	No <i>Bid Security</i> attached

	8,564,557.78 - (OTJ-01) 9,403,067.92 - (OTJ-14) 10,091,582.70 - (OTJ-15) 8,722,503.79 - (OTJ-02)		
13. Inek Investment cc	9,024,821.04 - (OTJ-06) 9,040,772.01 - (OTJ-08) 7,350,339.20 - (OTJ-09) 8,788,600.78 - (OTJ-11) 8,177,427.07 - (OTJ-01) 8,425,641.23 - (OTJ-14) 9,100,906.23 - (OTJ-15) 9,579,491.61 - (OTJ-02)	No	Bidder has not provided in the Bidder's Qualification Forms: Part F. information about major relevant contracts successfully completed over a period of 3 years minimum. Refer to Clause 6.3 (b); Bidder has not submitted references provided by contracting parties to the contracts successfully completed in the course of the past years with a budget of at least (1.5M per annum) Refer to clause 6.3 (a) and 6.3 (b)
14. Kahatjipara Investment cc	9,441,406.10 - (OTJ-06) 8,856,039.48 - (OTJ-08) 8,275,917.50 - (OTJ-09) 9,640,599.50 - (OTJ-11) 10,118,275.00 - (OTJ-01) 9,795,930.00 - (OTJ-14) 9,065,391.70 - (OTJ-15) 10,474,855.50 - (OTJ-02)	No	Bidder has not submitted references provided by contracting parties to the contracts successfully completed in the course of the past years with a budget of at least (1.5M per annum) Refer to clause 6.3 (a) and 6.3 (b); Bidder has not submitted proof of availability of relevant qualified personnel.
15. P. T. Puye Trading cc	10,255,426.88 - (OTJ-06) 9,556,952.43 - (OTJ-08) 8,367,003.25 - (OTJ-09) 9,115,354.25 - (OTJ-11) 8,555,655.00 - (OTJ-01) 9,329,311.75 - (OTJ-14) 9,703,935.75 - (OTJ-15) 10,103,658.50 - (OTJ-02)	No	Bidder has not submitted proof of construction financial income of a minimum of N\$ 1.5M per year over the last 2 years. (Refer to clauses 6.2 (f) and 6.3 (a); Bidder has not submitted proof of availability of Financial Resources issued by the bank or other financial institution (Minimum = N\$ 500 000 to qualify for award of a BMU). Refer to clause 6.3 (e) and Form FIN 3.3.
16. FA Developers cc	9,941,056.55 - (OTJ-06) 9,893,760.50 - (OTJ-08) 8,622,495.88 - (OTJ-09) 9,524,329.90 - (OTJ-11)	Yes	

	9,186,720.38 - (OTJ-01) 9,746,359.25 - (OTJ-14) 10,217,768.40 - (OTJ-15) 10,722,858.75 - (OTJ-02)		
17. Pelico Engineering Group cc	8,748,026.18 - (OTJ-06) 8,653,354.63 - (OTJ-08) 7,339,555.07 - (OTJ-09) 9,116,158.10 - (OTJ-11) 8,200,386.31 - (OTJ-01) 8,486,191.50 - (OTJ-14) 8,653,809.05 - (OTJ-15) 9,255,847.91 - (OTJ-02)	Yes	
18. Olukonda Trading Enterprises cc	9,725,832.01 - (OTJ-06) 9,994,082.06 - (OTJ-08) 7,732,583.78 - (OTJ-09) 9,089,750.24 - (OTJ-11) 8,485,891.37 - (OTJ-01) 10,766,545.87 - (OTJ-14) 10,730,908.47 - (OTJ-15) 10,446,001.77 - (OTJ-02)	No	Bidder has not submitted the duly filled in, signed, stamped, and dated Letter of Bid; Offered period of validity of the bid is not in line with the period stipulated in ITB Sub-clause 19.
19. Ebdina Trading cc	10,323,446.50 - (OTJ-06) 10,081,653.25 - (OTJ-08) 8,743,852.50 - (OTJ-09) 9,534,152.50 - (OTJ-11) 9,179,256.88 - (OTJ-01) 10,019,524.50 - (OTJ-14) 10,468,363.75 - (OTJ-15) 10,972,874.50 - (OTJ-02)	Yes	
20. Manipi Investment cc	6,748,119.63 - (OTJ-06) 7,047,897.13 - (OTJ-08) 6,150,532.93 - (OTJ-09) 6,678,452.50 - (OTJ-11) 9,893,245.88 - (OTJ-01) 7,423,066.00 - (OTJ-14) 8,668,815.00 - (OTJ-15) 10,424,750.00 - (OTJ-02)	No	No Bid Security attached
21. Tossendi Investments cc	10,425,407.09 - (OTJ-06) 10,657,316.46 - (OTJ-08) 9,137,143.34 - (OTJ-09) 9,738,509.65 - (OTJ-11)	No	Bidder has not submitted references provided by contracting parties to the contracts successfully completed in the course of the past years with a budget of at least

	9,497,911.13 - (OTJ-01) 9,967,910.92 - (OTJ-14) 11,187,740.94 - (OTJ-15) 10,988,892.64 - (OTJ-02)		(1.5M per annum) Refer to clause 6.3 (a) and 6.3 (b); Bidder has not submitted proof of availability of relevant qualified personnel.
22. Albatros Investment (Pty) Ltd	9,430,391.00 - (OTJ-06) 9,584,951.00 - (OTJ-08) 8,302,833.25 - (OTJ-09) 8,920,101.50 - (OTJ-11) 8,511,713.50 - (OTJ-01) 8,836,140.00 - (OTJ-14) 9,648,873.75 - (OTJ-15) 9,699,583.00 - (OTJ-02)	No	Bidder has not submitted the duly filled in, signed, stamped, and dated Letter of Bid; Offered period of validity of the bid is not in line with the period stipulated in ITB Sub-clause 19.
23. W. T. Business Group & Kucha Investment Joint Venture	6,533,046.50 - (OTJ-06) 6,501,645.75 - (OTJ-08) 5,371,908.75 - (OTJ-09) 6,126,452.50 - (OTJ-11) 8,177,779.38 - (OTJ-01) 5,958,437.50 - (OTJ-14) 7,255,522.50 - (OTJ-15) 7,730,185.00 - (OTJ-02)	No	No <i>Bid Security</i> attached
24. Centurion Investments (Pty) Ltd	8,685,145.61 - (OTJ-06) 8,497,568.24 - (OTJ-08) 7,563,137.92 - (OTJ-09) 8,694,308.63 - (OTJ-11) 7,987,869.15 - (OTJ-01) 8,535,242.98 - (OTJ-14) 8,891,903.82 - (OTJ-15) 9,440,268.43 - (OTJ-02)	Yes	
25. Makopa Investment cc	8,843,300.77 - (OTJ-06) 9,528,449.89 - (OTJ-08) 7,661,580.74 - (OTJ-09) 9,533,215.31 - (OTJ-11) 8,079,462.85 - (OTJ-01) 9,495,568.63 - (OTJ-14) 9,002,551.04 - (OTJ-15) 10,265,034.90 - (OTJ-02)	No	Bidder has not provided in the Bidder's Qualification Forms: Part F. information about major relevant contracts successfully completed over a period of 3 years minimum. Refer to Clause 6.3 (b); Bidder has not submitted references provided by contracting parties to the contracts successfully completed in the course of the past years with a

			budget of at least (1.5M per annum) Refer to clause 6.3(a) and 6.3 (b)
26. Moza Investments cc	10,401,577.79 - (OTJ-06) 10,203,840.69 - (OTJ-08) 8,872,634.68 - (OTJ-09) 9,649,469.45 - (OTJ-11) 9,342,464.01 - (OTJ-01) 9,969,932.13 - (OTJ-14) 10,501,822.43 - (OTJ-15) 10,966,114.69 - (OTJ-02)	Yes	
27. Drew Builders cc	8,796,025.62 - (OTJ-06) 8,629,128.43 - (OTJ-08) 7,305,060.52 - (OTJ-09) 8,395,402.36 - (OTJ-11) 7,642,267.09 - (OTJ-01) 8,122,426.18 - (OTJ-14) 8,729,351.66 - (OTJ-15) 9,251,825.10 - (OTJ-02)	No	Bidder has not submitted references provided by contracting parties to the contracts successfully completed in the course of the past years with a budget of at least (1.5M per annum) Refer to clause 6.3(a) and 6.3 (b); No Proposals for the timely acquisition of (own, lease or hire) of the essential equipment (Section IV: Bidding Forms: Part E: Technical Proposal) Refer to clause 6.3 (c).
28. Mashani Construction cc	10,320,330.00 - (OTJ-06) 10,228,767.00 - (OTJ-08) 8,582,910.00 - (OTJ-09) 9,711,485.50 - (OTJ-11) 9,084,741.25 - (OTJ-01) 9,561,560.00 - (OTJ-14) 10,113,790.00 - (OTJ-15) 10,505,951.50 - (OTJ-02)	No	Bidder has not submitted signed and dated balance-sheet, the profit and loss account or other appropriate financial statement as per the Bidder's Qualification Forms: Part F and ITB 6.2 (f); Bidder has not submitted proof of construction financial income of a minimum of N\$ 1.5M per year over the last 2 years. (Refer to clauses 6.2 (f) and 6.3 (a); Bidder has not submitted proof of availability of Financial Resources issued by the bank or other financial institution (Minimum = N\$ 500 000 to qualify for award of a BMU). Refer to clause 6.3 (e) and Form FIN 3.3.



<p>29. ALH Construction cc</p>	<p>9,669,570.38 - (OTJ-06) 9,457,696.34 - (OTJ-08) 8,433,913.78 - (OTJ-09) 9,705,661.87 - (OTJ-11) 8,908,725.38 - (OTJ-01) 9,548,859.94 - (OTJ-14) 9,961,842.84 - (OTJ-15) 10,568,563.45 - (OTJ-02)</p>	<p>No</p>	<p>Bidder has not submitted signed and dated balance-sheet, the profit and loss account or other appropriate financial statement as per the Bidder's Qualification Forms: Part F and ITB 6.2 (f); Bidder has not submitted proof of construction financial income of a minimum of N\$ 1.5M per year over the last 2 years. (Refer to clauses 6.2 (f) and 6.3 (a); Bidder has not submitted proof of availability of Financial Resources issued by the bank or other financial institution (Minimum = N\$ 500 000 to qualify for award of a BMU). Refer to clause 6.3 (e) and Form FIN 3.3.</p>
<p>30. Danny's Building Construction cc</p>	<p>9,123,214.03 - (OTJ-06) 8,944,290.62 - (OTJ-08) 7,876,587.35 - (OTJ-09) 8,775,066.87 - (OTJ-11) 8,251,712.92 - (OTJ-01) 8,953,217.64 - (OTJ-14) 9,284,428.33 - (OTJ-15) 9,693,370.36 - (OTJ-02)</p>	<p>Yes</p>	
<p>31. Blue Ray Trading Enterprises cc</p>	<p>8,820,845.00 - (OTJ-06) 8,703,085.00 - (OTJ-08) 7,222,057.50 - (OTJ-09) 8,915,662.50 - (OTJ-11) 8,051,178.75 - (OTJ-01) 8,275,860.00 - (OTJ-14) 8,665,652.50 - (OTJ-15) 9,181,628.75 - (OTJ-02)</p>	<p>No</p>	<p>No Bid Security attached</p>
<p>32. Hiamutiti Investment cc</p>	<p>0 - (OTJ-06) 5,979,304.25 - (OTJ-08) 8,558,886.50 - (OTJ-09) 0 - (OTJ-11) 0 - (OTJ-01) 7,406,684.25 - (OTJ-14) 8,081,510.00 - (OTJ-15)</p>	<p>Yes</p>	

	8,225,030.00 - (OTJ-02)		
33. Earth Ethix cc	9,612,574.70 - (OTJ-06) 8,816,469.48 - (OTJ-08) 8,292,892.82 - (OTJ-09) 8,779,783.50 - (OTJ-11) 8,869,278.57 - (OTJ-01) 8,671,070.84 - (OTJ-14) 9,735,089.94 - (OTJ-15) 9,537,644.43 - (OTJ-02)	Yes	
34. Qatar Investment cc	9,329,059.60 - (OTJ-06) 8,692,035.90 - (OTJ-08) 8,040,375.64 - (OTJ-09) 8,478,536.02 - (OTJ-11) 8,403,916.97 - (OTJ-01) 9,121,911.37 - (OTJ-14) 9,503,740.86 - (OTJ-15) 9,918,000.14 - (OTJ-02)	Yes	
35. Khankan Trading cc	10,230,937.05 - (OTJ-06) 10,225,205.45 - (OTJ-08) 8,733,525.50 - (OTJ-09) 10,131,937.00 - (OTJ-11) 9,237,117.00 - (OTJ-01) 10,048,119.25 - (OTJ-14) 10,714,394.75 - (OTJ-15) 11,399,202.50 - (OTJ-02)	Yes	
36. Eli Tjisola Trading Enterprises cc	8,757,669.75 - (OTJ-06) 8,606,255.00 - (OTJ-08) 7,327,685.00 - (OTJ-09) 8,170,002.50 - (OTJ-11) 7,856,627.50 - (OTJ-01) 8,291,586.25 - (OTJ-14) 8,738,936.25 - (OTJ-15) 9,217,830.75 - (OTJ-02)	No	Bidder has not submitted proof of construction financial income of a minimum of N\$ 1.5M per year over the last 2 years. (Refer to clauses 6.2 (f) and 6.3 (a); Bidder has not submitted proof of availability of Financial Resources issued by the bank or other financial institution (Minimum = N\$ 500 000 to qualify for award of a BMU). Refer to clause 6.3 (e) and Form FIN 3.3.
37. Almo Trading cc	9,227,217.61 - (OTJ-06) 9,623,827.81 - (OTJ-08) 8,149,484.95 - (OTJ-09) 8,416,579.35 - (OTJ-11)	No	Bidder has not provided in the Bidder's Qualification Forms: Part F. information about major relevant contracts successfully

	0 - (OTJ-01) 0 - (OTJ-14) 0 - (OTJ-15) 0 - (OTJ-02)		completed over a period of 3 years minimum. Refer to Clause 6.3 (b) Bidder has not submitted references provided by contracting parties to the contracts successfully completed in the course of the past years with a budget of at least (1.5M per annum) Refer to clause 6.3(a) and 6.3 (b). No Proposals for the timely acquisition of (own, lease or hire) of the essential equipment (Section IV: Bidding Forms: Part E: Technical Proposal) Refer to clause 6.3(c)
38. XL Investments cc	9,321,498.65 - (OTJ-06) 9,269,777.40 - (OTJ-08) 8,123,820.23 - (OTJ-09) 8,655,809.08 - (OTJ-11) 8,352,627.10 - (OTJ-01) 8,891,649.93 - (OTJ-14) 9,309,623.18 - (OTJ-15) 9,606,874.78 - (OTJ-02)	Yes	
39. Gomeb Trading Enterprises cc	7,317,317.75 - (OTJ-06) 7,257,431.50 - (OTJ-08) 6,352,657.50 - (OTJ-09) 6,866,477.50 - (OTJ-11) 9,951,320.88 - (OTJ-01) 6,910,741.00 - (OTJ-14) 8,817,161.65 - (OTJ-15) 10,466,667.50 - (OTJ-02)	No	No <i>Bid Security</i> attached
40. Queen Mwetako, Erf 15	0 - (OTJ-06) 0 - (OTJ-08) 0 - (OTJ-09) 0 - (OTJ-11) 9,191,160.76 - (OTJ-01) 9,442,127.79 - (OTJ-14) 8,547,227.11 - (OTJ-15) 7,976,573.36 - (OTJ-02)	Yes	

41. Luludrey's Investments cc	9,775,371.80 - (OTJ-06) 11,125,310.36 - (OTJ-08) 9,541,153.37 - (OTJ-09) 10,033,777.83 - (OTJ-11) 11,429,865.93 - (OTJ-01) 11,352,34270 - (OTJ-14) 12,653,509.05 - (OTJ-15) 13,572,602.22 - (OTJ-02)	No	No <i>Bid Security</i> attached
42. Colonel Investment cc	11,865,914.47 - (OTJ-06) 8,953,109.37 - (OTJ-08) 8,832,135.12 - (OTJ-09) 9,903,817.25 - (OTJ-11) 8,028,817.00 - (OTJ-01) 8,603,544.45 - (OTJ-14) 9,022,911.50 - (OTJ-15) 9,526,222.80 - (OTJ-02)	No	Bidder has not submitted signed and dated balance-sheet, the profit and loss account or other appropriate financial statement as per the Bidder's Qualification Forms: Part F and ITB 6.2 (f); Bidder has not submitted proof of construction financial income of a minimum of N\$ 1.5M per year over the last 2 years. (Refer to clauses 6.2 (f) and 6.3 (a).
43. Florida Trading cc	8,358,682.49 - (OTJ-06) 6,432,145.12 - (OTJ-08) 7,670,355.28 - (OTJ-09) 6,694,609.29 - (OTJ-11) 7,559,451.24 - (OTJ-01) 6,410,855.85 - (OTJ-14) 7,455,990.22 - (OTJ-15) 7,934,099.91 - (OTJ-02)	Yes	
44. Uibasen Trading Enterprises cc	8,796,025.62 - (OTJ-06) 8,629,128.43 - (OTJ-08) 7,305,060.52 - (OTJ-09) 8,395,402.36 - (OTJ-11) 7,642,267.09 - (OTJ-01) 8,122,426.18 - (OTJ-14) 8,729,351.66 - (OTJ-15) 9,251,825.10 - (OTJ-02)	No	Bidder has not submitted signed and dated balance-sheet, the profit and loss account or other appropriate financial statement as per the Bidder's Qualification Forms: Part F and ITB 6.2 (f); Bidder has not submitted proof of construction financial income of a minimum of N\$ 1.5M per year over the last 2 years. (Refer to clauses 6.2 (f) and 6.3 (a).

45. Fresnaye Trading Enterprises cc	8,796,025.62 - (OTJ-06) 8,629,128.43 - (OTJ-08) 7,305,060.52 - (OTJ-09) 8,395,402.36 - (OTJ-11) 7,642,267.09 - (OTJ-01) 8,122,426.18 - (OTJ-14) 8,729,351.66 - (OTJ-15) 9,251,825.10 - (OTJ-02)	No	Bidder has not submitted the duly filled in, signed, stamped, and dated Letter of Bid; Offered period of validity of the bid is not in line with the period stipulated in ITB Sub-clause 19.
46. Ombuka Enterprise cc	10,260,070.16 - (OTJ-06) 10,202,937.36 - (OTJ-08) 8,445,489.60 - (OTJ-09) 9,202,610.71 - (OTJ-11) 8,925,093.65 - (OTJ-01) 8,864,873.90 - (OTJ-14) 9,803,746.91 - (OTJ-15) 10,136,755.75 - (OTJ-02)	No	Bidder does not have an original valid good Standing Tax Certificate (Supplied certified copy only); Bidder does not have a valid certified copy of Affirmative Action Compliance Certificate, proof from Employment Equity Commissioner that bidder is not a relevant employer, or exemption issued in terms of Section 42 of the Affirmative Action Act, 1998.
47. Namshine Investment cc	8,926,340.00 - (OTJ-06) 8,717,898.00 - (OTJ-08) 7,531,572.00 - (OTJ-09) 8,316,420.00 - (OTJ-11) 7,860,789.00 - (OTJ-01) 8,376,382.00 - (OTJ-14) 8,788,051.00 - (OTJ-15) 9,205,688.00 - (OTJ-02)	Yes	
48. Casleno Investments cc, Erf 39, City Height, Windhoek	9,902,848.72 - (OTJ-06) 9,698,105.60 - (OTJ-08) 8,214,028.93 - (OTJ-09) 9,037,356.43 - (OTJ-11) 8,630,968.90 - (OTJ-01) 8,904,708.00 - (OTJ-14) 9,724,152.06 - (OTJ-15) 10,141,814.18 - (OTJ-02)	No	No Proposals for the timely acquisition of (own, lease or hire) of the essential equipment (Section IV: Bidding Forms: Part E: Technical Proposal) Refer to clause 6.3 (c).
49. Guiob's Trading Enterprises cc	8,279,438.80 - (OTJ-06) 8,165,262.20 - (OTJ-08) 7,157,278.00 - (OTJ-09) 7,809,759.25 - (OTJ-11) 7,253,257.00 - (OTJ-01)	No	No Bid Security attached

	7,713,159.25 - (OTJ-14) 8,471,526.75 - (OTJ-15) 8,455,334.75 - (OTJ-02)		
50. Ondjirakomurungu Cleaning Services cc	0 - (OTJ-06) 0 - (OTJ-08) 8,745,002.50 - (OTJ-09) 0 - (OTJ-11) 7,962,673.03 - (OTJ-01) 0 - (OTJ-14) 8,491,053.75 - (OTJ-15) 8,468,490.75 - (OTJ-02)	Yes	
51. Dotas Trading cc	8,996,985.33 - (OTJ-06) 9,023,849.33 - (OTJ-08) 7,351,644.68 - (OTJ-09) 8,806,102.00 - (OTJ-11) 8,060,168.88 - (OTJ-01) 8,443,291.49 - (OTJ-14) 9,130,128.99 - (OTJ-15) 9,610,739.64 - (OTJ-02)	Yes	
52. Tuapewa Prospecting cc	7,201,541.50 - (OTJ-06) 7,099,450.25 - (OTJ-08) 5,816,901.25 - (OTJ-09) 6,394,977.50 - (OTJ-11) 9,919,839.63 - (OTJ-01) 6,888,891.00 - (OTJ-14) 8,760,240.00 - (OTJ-15) 10,564,877.50 - (OTJ-02)	No	No Bid Security attached
53. Rhitunga Trading Enterprise cc	9,413,075.36 - (OTJ-06) 9,788,215.78 - (OTJ-08) 8,146,298.22 - (OTJ-09) 9,504,475.71 - (OTJ-11) 9,217,017.84 - (OTJ-01) 9,171,387.43 - (OTJ-14) 9,866,374.86 - (OTJ-15) 10,541,401.03 - (OTJ-02)	Yes	
54. Hibachi Investment Holdings (PTY) LTD.	9,573,170.76 - (OTJ-06) 8,653,151.39 - (OTJ-08) 8,282,416.84 - (OTJ-09) 8,657,571.67 - (OTJ-11) 8,738,612.58 - (OTJ-01)	Yes	

	8,623,780.92 - (OTJ-14) 9,746,487.16 - (OTJ-15) 9,315,132.02 - (OTJ-02)		
55. Lungile Investment cc JV G. D. Pest Control Investment	9,901,515.18 - (OTJ-06) 9,623,968.55 - (OTJ-08) 7,145,453.82 - (OTJ-09) 9,160,657.95 - (OTJ-11) 8,271,044.26 - (OTJ-01) 9,612,666.46 - (OTJ-14) 9,522,320.28 - (OTJ-15) 10,650,779.51 - (OTJ-02)	No	No Bid Security attached
56. Matanga Investment cc	8,870,690.60 - (OTJ-06) 8,803,161.45 - (OTJ-08) 7,362,334.50 - (OTJ-09) 8,865,714.55 - (OTJ-11) 7,925,897.75 - (OTJ-01) 8,445,381.50 - (OTJ-14) 8,802,848.65 - (OTJ-15) 9,095,908.90 - (OTJ-02)	No	No Bid Security attached
57. E/B Trading Enterprises cc	8,305,355.00 - (OTJ-06) 7,894,643.28 - (OTJ-08) 6,356,959.70 - (OTJ-09) 5,451,842.37 - (OTJ-11) 6,661,452.91 - (OTJ-01) 5,856,855.12 - (OTJ-14) 8,113,868.12 - (OTJ-15) 7,161,517.83 - (OTJ-02)	No	No Bid Security attached
58. Goreseb Trading cc	8,629,688.18 - (OTJ-06) 8,629,128.43 - (OTJ-08) 7,103,760.50 - (OTJ-09) 8,228,035.96 - (OTJ-11) 7,766,467.09 - (OTJ-01) 8,013,290.03 - (OTJ-14) 8,729,351.66 - (OTJ-15) 9,142,960.92 - (OTJ-02)	Yes	
59. D. P. G. Civil Engineering cc	9,163,499.51 - (OTJ-06) 8,981,818.56 - (OTJ-08) 7,839,733.93 - (OTJ-09) 8,476,199.29 - (OTJ-11) 8,269,654.19 - (OTJ-01)	No	Bidder has not submitted a company Registration Certificate; Bidder does not have an original valid good Standing Tax Certificate Bidder has an

	8,810,398.10 - (OTJ-14) 9,279,138.71 - (OTJ-15) 9,695,295.36 - (OTJ-02)		original valid good Standing Social Security Certificate; Bidder does not have a valid certified copy of Affirmative Action Compliance Certificate, proof from Employment Equity Commissioner that bidder is not a relevant employer, or exemption issued in terms of Section 42 of the Affirmative Action Act, 1998;  Bidder does not have a certificate indicating SME Status (for Bids reserved for SMEs); (Supplied certified copies only)
60. Khan Trading cc	0 - (OTJ-06) 0 - (OTJ-08) 8,359,723.75 - (OTJ-09) 9,380,607.50 - (OTJ-11) 7,371,183.75 - (OTJ-01) 6,608,877.50 - (OTJ-14) 9,245,034.00 - (OTJ-15) 9,592,679.00 - (OTJ-02)	Yes	
61. Hohee Trading cc	10,123,128.00 - (OTJ-06) 9,905,973.50 - (OTJ-08) 8,599,369.38 - (OTJ-09) 9,274,077.25 - (OTJ-11) 9,234,712.75 - (OTJ-01) 9,680,303.25 - (OTJ-14) 10,201,391.25 - (OTJ-15) 10,681,681.85 - (OTJ-02)	No	Bidder has not submitted Written statement by a power of attorney (or notary statement, etc.) proving that the person, who signed the bid on behalf of the company/joint venture/consortium, is duly authorized to do so (ITB Sub-clause 21.2).
62. John Namusheshe Construction & Investments cc	9,065,716.48 - (OTJ-06) 9,067,324.07 - (OTJ-08) 7,360,761.07 - (OTJ-09) 8,807,374.53 - (OTJ-11) 8,197,925.82 - (OTJ-01) 8,430,761.61 - (OTJ-14) 9,112,018.10 - (OTJ-15) 9,584,902.36 - (OTJ-02)	Yes	The bidder has not submitted a valid Bid Security in accordance with ITB Clause 20.



63. Ondjove Trading & Constructions cc	9,177,582.51 - (OTJ-06) 8,945,174.25 - (OTJ-08) 7,855,269.81 - (OTJ-09) 8,523,860.84 - (OTJ-11) 8,329,194.87 - (OTJ-01) 8,628,828.12 - (OTJ-14) 9,074,779.26 - (OTJ-15) 9,642,555.54 - (OTJ-02)	Yes	
64. Shiveli Trading Enterprises cc,	9,975,722.32 - (OTJ-06) 9,995,854.34 - (OTJ-08) 10,055,261.61 - (OTJ-09) 12,165,308.64 - (OTJ-11) 11,046,103.34 - (OTJ-01) 11,414,920.99 - (OTJ-14) 12,134,148.24 - (OTJ-15) 12,373,739.24 - (OTJ-02)	Yes	
65. Alughodi Construction & Renovation cc	9,447,122.06 - (OTJ-06) 9,313,966.66 - (OTJ-08) 8,111,904.50 - (OTJ-09) 8,767,494.43 - (OTJ-11) 8,278,077.98 - (OTJ-01) 9,027,436.18 - (OTJ-14) 9,413,102.88 - (OTJ-15) 9,785,423.37 - (OTJ-02)	Yes	
66. Kauna Builders cc	9,807,473.70 - (OTJ-06) 9,622,253.55 - (OTJ-08) 8,383,425.25 - (OTJ-09) 10,377,893.25 - (OTJ-11) 9,262,344.38 - (OTJ-01) 9,245,266.88 - (OTJ-14) 9,696,601.63 - (OTJ-15) 10,288,993.65 - (OTJ-02)	Yes	
67. Opuwo Vature Vahimba Investment cc	9,199,471.00 - (OTJ-06) 9,052,650.50 - (OTJ-08) 7,216,307.50 - (OTJ-09) 10,180,030.00 - (OTJ-11) 7,654,831.25 - (OTJ-01) 8,140,447.10 - (OTJ-14) 8,384,477.50 - (OTJ-15) 8,935,074.50 - (OTJ-02)	No	Bidder has not submitted references provided by contracting parties to the contracts successfully completed in the course of the past years with a budget of at least (1.5M per annum) Refer to clause 6.3(a) and 6.3 (b).

68. Niilotes Investments cc,	9,269,330.57 - (OTJ-06) 9,072,569.19 - (OTJ-08) 7,979,373.84 - (OTJ-09) 8,657,336.16 - (OTJ-11) 8,282,876.73 - (OTJ-01) 8,970,291.24 - (OTJ-14) 9,371,258.86 - (OTJ-15) 9,764,497.34 - (OTJ-02)	Yes	
69. Ronam Investment cc	9,454,066.63 - (OTJ-06) 9,330,292.13 - (OTJ-08) 8,002,835.63 - (OTJ-09) 8,908,963.75 - (OTJ-11) 8,399,154.38 - (OTJ-01) 9,000,015.00 - (OTJ-14) 9,378,020.00 - (OTJ-15) 9,779,766.75 - (OTJ-02)	No	Bidder has not provided in the Bidder's Qualification Forms: Part F. information about major relevant contracts successfully completed over a period of 3 years minimum. Refer to Clause 6.3 (b); Bidder has not submitted references provided by contracting parties to the contracts successfully completed in the course of the past years with a budget of at least (1.5M per annum) Refer to clause 6.3(a) and 6.3 (b).
70. RCC Projects (PTY) LTD.	8,672,317.13 - (OTJ-06) 8,561,003.95 - (OTJ-08) 7,041,409.55 - (OTJ-09) 8,036,979.47 - (OTJ-11) 7,512,317.13 - (OTJ-01) 7,831,924.96 - (OTJ-14) 8,266,045.09 - (OTJ-15) 8,588,824.69 - (OTJ-02)	No	Bidder has not submitted a company Registration Certificate
71. Twalonga Pro-Construct cc	9,170,836.92 - (OTJ-06) 9,195,742.36 - (OTJ-08) 7,877,175.36 - (OTJ-09) 8,666,405.41 - (OTJ-11) 8,014,646.99 - (OTJ-01) 8,664,045.65 - (OTJ-14) 9,122,263.68 - (OTJ-15) 9,533,966.21 - (OTJ-02)	No	Bidder has not provided in the Bidder's Qualification Forms: Part F. information about major relevant contracts successfully completed over a period of 3 years minimum. Refer to Clause 6.3 (b); Bidder has not submitted references provided by contracting parties to the contracts successfully completed in the

			course of the past years with a budget of at least (1.5M per annum) Refer to clause 6.3(a) and 6.3 (b); No Proposals for the timely acquisition of (own, lease or hire) of the essential equipment (Section IV: Bidding Forms: Part E: Technical Proposal) Refer to clause 6.3(c)
72. Salath SH Trading cc	7,573,497.00 - (OTJ-06) 7,583,780.00 - (OTJ-08) 6,424,647.50 - (OTJ-09) 9,207,130.00 - (OTJ-11) 10,392,233.00 - (OTJ-01) 8,236,760.00 - (OTJ-14) 8,840,452.50 - (OTJ-15) 11,062,275.00 - (OTJ-02)	No	Bidder does not have a valid certified copy of Affirmative Action Compliance Certificate, proof from Employment Equity Commissioner that bidder is not a relevant employer, or exemption issued in terms of Section 42 of the Affirmative Action Act, 1998.
73. Ndjamo Duilders cc	9,940,684.89 - (OTJ-06) 9,772,880.84 - (OTJ-08) 8,478,306.00 - (OTJ-09) 9,635,620.00 - (OTJ-11) 8,099,651.25 - (OTJ-01) 8,687,013.75 - (OTJ-14) 9,062,615.25 - (OTJ-15) 9,574,649.30 - (OTJ-02)	No	Bidder has not submitted signed and dated balance-sheet, the profit and loss account or other appropriate financial statement as per the Bidder's Qualification Forms: Part F and ITB 6.2 (f); Bidder has not submitted proof of construction financial income of a minimum of N\$ 1.5M per year over the last 2 years. (Refer to clauses 6.2 (f) and 6.3 (a)
74. Hilger Investment cc	8,992,672.83 - (OTJ-06) 8,276,636.83 - (OTJ-08) 7,355,094.68 - (OTJ-09) 8,795,407.00 - (OTJ-11) 9,572,993.88 - (OTJ-01) 8,207,368.99 - (OTJ-14) 9,958,068.99 - (OTJ-15) 9,396,264.64 - (OTJ-02)		
75. Insomnia Investments cc	10,144,306.11 - (OTJ-06) 9,734,905.25 - (OTJ-08) 8,359,631.75 - (OTJ-09) 9,092,074.80 - (OTJ-11)	No	Bidder has not provided in the Bidder's Qualification Forms: Part F. information about major relevant contracts successfully

	9,018,283.88 - (OTJ-01) 9,387,321.75 - (OTJ-14) 10,167,356.00 - (OTJ-15) 10,011,348.92 - (OTJ-02)		completed over a period of 3 years minimum. Refer to Clause 6.3 (b); Bidder has not submitted references provided by contracting parties to the contracts successfully completed in the course of the past years with a budget of at least (1.5M per annum) Refer to clause 6.3(a) and 6.3 (b).
76. Brumar Construction cc	10,751,479.86 - (OTJ-06) 8,914,600.69 - (OTJ-08) 10,506,540.06 - (OTJ-09) 9,996,431.41 - (OTJ-11) 9,666,036.34 - (OTJ-01) 9,961,454.43 - (OTJ-14) 10,465,848.42 - (OTJ-15) 11,069,564.40 - (OTJ-02)	Yes	
77. Vii Investment cc	8,357,288.63 - (OTJ-06) 8,305,467.33 - (OTJ-08) 6,839,058.63 - (OTJ-09) 7,987,353.75 - (OTJ-11) 7,286,612.75 - (OTJ-01) 7,619,273.25 - (OTJ-14) 8,199,919.75 - (OTJ-15) 8,593,524.50 - (OTJ-02)	No	No Proposals for the timely acquisition of (own, lease or hire) of the essential equipment (Section IV: Bidding Forms: Part E: Technical Proposal) Refer to clause 6.3(c)
78. Alnaa Capital Investments cc,	9,203,393.29 - (OTJ-06) 9,087,138.94 - (OTJ-08) 7,798,338.44 - (OTJ-09) 8,579,459.68 - (OTJ-11) 9,056,256.57 - (OTJ-01) 8,960,701.17 - (OTJ-14) 9,548,462.08 - (OTJ-15) 10,684,460.94 - (OTJ-02)	No	Bidder has not submitted signed and dated balance-sheet, the profit and loss account or other appropriate financial statement as per the Bidder's Qualification Forms: Part F and ITB 6.2 (f); Bidder has not submitted proof of construction financial income of a minimum of N\$ 1.5M per year over the last 2 years. (Refer to clauses 6.2 (f) and 6.3 (a); Bidder has not submitted proof of availability of Financial Resources issued by the bank or other

			financial institution (Minimum = N\$ 500 000 to qualify for award of a BMU). Refer to clause 6.3 (e) and Form FIN 3.3.
79. Bright Star Trading Enterprises cc	7,562,850.80 - (OTJ-06) 7,244,285.85 - (OTJ-08) 6,981,546.50 - (OTJ-09) 6,785,910.80 - (OTJ-11) 7,495,119.25 - (OTJ-01) 8,211,477.25 - (OTJ-14) 8,579,975.20 - (OTJ-15) 8,899,039.25 - (OTJ-02)	No	Bidder has not provided in the Bidder's Qualification Forms: Part F. information about major relevant contracts successfully completed over a period of 3 years minimum. Refer to Clause 6.3 (b); Bidder has not submitted references provided by contracting parties to the contracts successfully completed in the course of the past years with a budget of at least (1.5M per annum) Refer to clause 6.3(a) and 6.3 (b); No Proposals for the timely acquisition of (own, lease or hire) of the essential equipment (Section IV: Bidding Forms: Part E: Technical Proposal) Refer to clause 6.3(c); Bidder has not submitted proof of availability of relevant qualified personnel.
80. CAG Trading Enterprises cc	9,756,580.28 - (OTJ-06) 9,629,691.69 - (OTJ-08) 8,455,955.46 - (OTJ-09) 9,302,873.83 - (OTJ-11) 8,842,597.54 - (OTJ-01) 9,590,728.31 - (OTJ-14) 10,112,600.04 - (OTJ-15) 10,646,925.63 - (OTJ-02)	No	No <i>Bid Security</i> attached
81. Four Wings Roads Construction cc	0 - (OTJ-06) 5,037,447.50 - (OTJ-08) 0 - (OTJ-09) 0 - (OTJ-11) 0 - (OTJ-01) 6,635,416.14 - (OTJ-14) 0 - (OTJ-15)	No	No <i>Bid Security</i> attached

	0 - (OTJ-02)		
82. Gaomub Quick Security JV Construction Services cc	6,916,538.15 - (OTJ-06) 6,827,110.70 - (OTJ-08) 4,203,905.50 - (OTJ-09) 7,327,909.25 - (OTJ-11) 4,969,109.75 - (OTJ-01) 4,744,951.75 - (OTJ-14) 4,683,714.25 - (OTJ-15) 4,988,953.00 - (OTJ-02)	No	No <i>Bid Security</i> attached
83. Geronny Investment cc	9,051,360.37 - (OTJ-06) 9,470,784.77 - (OTJ-08) 6,578,770.85 - (OTJ-09) 10,161,658.98 - (OTJ-11) 6,961,120.95 - (OTJ-01) 7,144,536.69 - (OTJ-14) 7,612,476.29 - (OTJ-15) 8,009,457.67 - (OTJ-06)	No	No <i>Bid Security</i> attached
84. Marshellus Trading Enterprises cc	9,617,619.63 - (OTJ-08) 9,512,233.63 - (OTJ-09) 7,966,179.38 - (OTJ-11) 9,165,298.75 - (OTJ-01) 8,507,053.13 - (OTJ-14) 9,034,860.00 - (OTJ-15) 9,548,047.50 - (OTJ-02) 11,899,544.50 - (OTJ-06)	No	No <i>Bid Security</i> attached
85. Khuruseb Trading Enterprises cc	6,248,745.80 - (OTJ-06) 34,990,192.10 - (OTJ-08) 4,580,962.90 - (OTJ-09) 6,665,180.35 - (OTJ-11) 5,625,450.40 - (OTJ-01) 4,250,358.60 - (OTJ-14) 4,385,223.70 - (OTJ-15) 4,276,907.50 - (OTJ-02)	No	No <i>Bid Security</i> attached
86. Kaputu Maintenance Products cc	8,900,358.16, (OTJ-06) 9,816,357.54, (OTJ-08) 7,548,577.97, (OTJ-09) 8,271,323.92 - (OTJ-11) 8,321,404.47 - (OTJ-01) 8,205,193.98 - (OTJ-14) 9,026,125.82 - (OTJ-15)	No	No <i>Bid Security</i> attached

	9,312,411.50 - (OTJ-02)		
87. Eli Investments Five cc	10,461,429.37 - (OTJ-06) 10,252,995.66 - (OTJ-08) 8,926,123.94 - (OTJ-09) 9,673,800.46 - (OTJ-11) 12,529,411.46 - (OTJ-01) 10,049,513.51 - (OTJ-14) 13,695,979.51 - (OTJ-15) 14,177,281.08 - (OTJ-02)	No	No <i>Bid Security</i> attached
88. Baruch Investment cc	6,762,550.85 - (OTJ-06) 34,971,406.85 - (OTJ-08) 5,099,037.90 - (OTJ-09) 7,193,432.85 - (OTJ-11) 6,142,598.50 - (OTJ-01) 4,727,645.40 - (OTJ-14) 4,837,351.95 - (OTJ-15) 4,984,387.50 - (OTJ-02)	No	No <i>Bid Security</i> attached
89. Rainbow Youth Trading cc	0 - (OTJ-06) 7,767,722.00 - (OTJ-08) 6,780,059.67 - (OTJ-09) 7,414,608.09 - (OTJ-11) 6,946,230.00 - (OTJ-01) 7,536,985.50 - (OTJ-14) 7,773,609.00 - (OTJ-15) 8,404,089.60 - (OTJ-02)	No	Bidder has not submitted signed and dated balance-sheet, the profit and loss account or other appropriate financial statement as per the Bidder's Qualification Forms: Part F and ITB 6.2 (f); Bidder has not submitted proof of construction financial income of a minimum of N\$ 1.5M per year over the last 2 years. (Refer to clauses 6.2 (f) and 6.3 (a); Bidder has not submitted proof of availability of Financial Resources issued by the bank or other financial institution (Minimum = N\$ 500 000 to qualify for award of a BMU). Refer to clause 6.3 (e) and Form FIN 3.3.
90. J Three Investment cc	9,841,774.75 - OTJ-06) 9,720,300.25 - (OTJ-08) 8,113,451.25 - (OTJ-09) 9,341,766.25 - (OTJ-11) 8,644,722.50 - (OTJ-01)	Yes	

	9,442,362.50 - (OTJ-14) 9,804,095.00 - (OTJ-15) 10,247,983.50 - (OTJ-02)		
91. Lau Tom Construction	9,075,011.10 - (OTJ-06) 8,965,080.30 - (OTJ-08) 7,707,944.00 - (OTJ-09) 8,540,381.50 - (OTJ-11) 8,084,546.00 - (OTJ-01) 8,711,227.00 - (OTJ-14) 9,245,494.00 - (OTJ-15) 9,701,101.00 - (OTJ-02)	Yes	

8. Price comparison for bids that are substantially responsive:

**CONTRACT AREA OTJ-06**

Name	A. Price at Bid Opening N\$	B. Bid Price after corrections	C. price after Adjustments N\$	D. Price after Margin of Preference <i>[If applicable]</i>	Rank
Lau Tom Construction cc	9,075,011.10	9,075,011.10	9,075,011.10	N/A	1
Nilotse Investment cc	9,269,330.57	9,269,330.57	9,269,330.57	N/A	2
Namshine Investment	8,926,340.00	8,926,340.00	8,926,340.00	N/A	3
Pelico Engineering Group	8,748,026.18	8,748,026.18	8,748,026.18	N/A	4
Danny's Building Construction cc	9,123,214.03	9,123,214.03	9,123,214.03	N/A	5
Rhitunga Trading Enterprise cc	9,413,075.36	9,413,075.36	9,413,075.36	N/A	6
Ondjove Trading & Constructions cc	9,177,582.51	9,177,582.51	9,177,582.51	N/A	7
Dotas Trading cc	8,996,985.33	8,996,985.33	8,996,985.33	N/A	8



Hibachi Investment Holdings (PTY) LTD	9,573,170.76	9,573,170.76	9,573,170.76	N/A	9
Kauna Builders	9,807,473.70	9,807,473.70	9,807,473.70	N/A	10
Earth Ethix cc	9,612,574.70	9,612,574.70	9,612,574.70	N/A	11
Alughodi Construction cc	9,447,122.06	9,447,122.06	9,447,122.06	N/A	12
Pisces Investment Holdings	8,903,052.54	8,903,052.54	8,903,052.54	N/A	13
F. A. Developers cc	9,941,056.55	9,941,056.55	9,941,056.55	N/A	14
Shiveli	9,975,722.32	9,975,722.32	9,975,722.32	N/A	15
Hilger Investment cc	8,992,672.83	8,992,672.83	8,992,672.83	N/A	16
Khankan Trading Enterprises	10,230,937.05	10,230,937.05	10,230,937.05	N/A	17
J Three Investment cc	9,841,774.75	9,841,774.75	9,841,774.75	N/A	18
Moza Investment cc	10,401,577.79	10,401,577.79	10,401,577.79	N/A	19
XL Investments cc	9,321,498.65	9,321,498.65	9,321,498.65	N/A	20
Qatar Investments cc	9,329,059.60	9,329,059.60	9,329,059.60	N/A	21
Shatty Construction cc	10,260,741.03	10,260,741.03	10,260,741.03	N/A	22
Ebdina Trading Enterprises cc	10,323,446.50	10,323,446.50	10,323,446.50	N/A	23
Potenza Investment cc	11,449,981.01	11,449,981.01	11,449,981.01	N/A	24
Brumar Construction cc	10,751,479.86	10,751,479.86	10,751,479.86	N/A	25

#### CONTRACT AREA OTJ-08

Name	A. Price at Bid Opening N\$	B. Bid Price after corrections	C. price after Adjustments N\$	D. Price after Margin of Preference [If applicable]	Rank
------	-----------------------------	--------------------------------	--------------------------------	---	------

Goreseb Trading cc	8,629,128.43	8,629,128.43	8,629,128.43	N/A	1
Hibachi Investment Holdings (PTY) LTD	8,653,151.39	8,653,151.39	8,653,151.39	N/A	2
Lau Tom Construction cc	8,965,080.30	8,965,080.30	8,965,080.30	N/A	3
Nilotse Investment cc	9,072,569.19	9,072,569.19	9,072,569.19	N/A	4
Namshine	8,717,898.08	8,717,898.08	8,717,898.08	N/A	5
Earth Ethix cc	8,816,469.48	8,816,469.48	8,816,469.48	N/A	6
Danny's Building Construction cc	8,944,290.62	8,944,290.62	8,944,290.62	N/A	7
Pelico Engineering Group	8,653,354.63	8,653,354.63	8,653,354.63	N/A	8
Brumar Construction cc	8,914,600.69	8,914,600.69	8,914,600.69	N/A	9
Ondjove Trading & Constructions cc	8,945,174.25	8,945,174.25	8,945,174.25	N/A	10
Kauna Builders	9,622,253.55	9,622,253.55	9,622,253.55	N/A	11
Dotas Trading cc	9,023,849.33	9,023,849.33	9,023,849.33	N/A	12
Alughodi Construction cc	9,313,966.66	9,313,966.66	9,313,966.66	N/A	13
Qatar Investments cc	8,692,035.90	8,692,035.90	8,692,035.90	N/A	14

Pisces Investment Holdings	8,849,482.31	8,849,482.31	8,849,482.31	N/A	15
F. A. Developers cc	9,893,760.50	9,893,760.50	9,893,760.50	N/A	16
Rhitunga Trading Enterprise cc	9,788,215.78	9,788,215.78	9,788,215.78	N/A	17
Shiveli	9,995,854.34	9,995,854.34	9,995,854.34	N/A	18
Khankan Trading Enterprises	10,225,205.45	10,225,205.45	10,225,205.45	N/A	19
J Three Investment cc	9,720,300.25	9,720,300.25	9,720,300.25	N/A	20
Moza Investment cc	10,203,851.04	10,203,851.04	10,203,851.04	N/A	21
XL Investments cc	9,269,777.40	9,269,777.40	9,269,777.40	N/A	22
Shatty Construction cc	10,176,458.68	10,176,458.68	10,176,458.68	N/A	23
Ebdina Trading Enterprises cc	10,081,653.25	10,081,653.25	10,081,653.25	N/A	24
Potenza Investment cc	11,211,360.45	11,211,360.45	11,211,360.45	N/A	25

#### CONTRACT AREA OTJ-09

Name	A. Price at Bid Opening N\$	B. Bid Price after corrections	C. price after Adjustments N\$	D. Price after Margin of Preference [If applicable]	Rank
Nilotse Investment cc	7,979,373.84	7,979,373.84	7,979,373.84	N/A	1
Lau Tom Construction cc	7,707,944.00	7,707,944.00	7,707,944.00	N/A	2

Danny's Building Construction cc	7,876,587.35	7,876,587.35	7,876,587.35	N/A	3
Centurion Investments (Pty) Ltd	7,563,137.92	7,563,137.92	7,563,137.92	N/A	4
Khankan Trading Enterprises	8,733,525.50	8,733,525.50	8,733,525.50	N/A	5
Hiamutiti U. Investment cc	8,558,886.50	8,558,886.50	8,558,886.50	N/A	6
Ondjove Trading & Constructions cc	7,855,269.81	7,855,269.81	7,855,269.81	N/A	7
Rhitunga Trading Enterprise cc	8,146,298.22	8,146,298.22	8,146,298.22	N/A	8
Ondira Komurungu Cleaning Services cc	8,745,002.50	8,745,002.50	8,745,002.50	N/A	9
Florida Trading cc	7,670,355.28	7,773,443.34	7,773,443.34	N/A	10
Kauna Builders	8,383,425.25	8,383,425.25	8,383,425.25	N/A	11
Khan Trading cc	8,359,723.75	8,359,723.75	8,359,723.75	N/A	12
Hibachi Investment Holdings (PTY) LTD	8,282,416.84	8,282,416.84	8,282,416.84	N/A	13
Alughodi Construction cc	8,111,904.50	8,111,904.50	8,111,904.50	N/A	14
J Three Investment cc	8,113,451.25	8,113,451.25	8,113,451.25	N/A	15
Earth Ethix cc	8,292,892.82	8,292,892.82	8,292,892.82	N/A	16

Pisces Investment Holdings	7,737,257.64	7,737,257.64	7,737,257.64	N/A	17
F. A. Developers cc	8,622,495.88	8,622,495.88	8,622,495.88	N/A	18
Shatty Construction cc	8,511,855.53	8,511,855.53	8,511,855.53	N/A	19
Moza Investment cc	8,872,634.68	8,872,634.68	8,872,634.68	N/A	20
Potenza Investment cc	9,750,447.24	9,750,447.24	9,750,447.24	N/A	21
XL Investments cc	8,123,820.23	8,123,820.23	8,123,820.23	N/A	22
Qatar Investments cc	8,040,375.64	8,040,375.64	8,040,375.64	N/A	23
Ebdina Trading Enterprises cc	8,743,852.50	8,743,852.50	8,743,852.50	N/A	24
Dinaledi Investments	8,608,509.86	8,608,509.86	8,608,509.86	N/A	25
Shiveli	10,055,261.61	10,055,261.61	10,055,261.61	N/A	26
Brumar Construction cc	10,506,540.06	10,506,540.06	10,506,540.06	N/A	27

**CONTRACT AREA OTJ-11**

Name	A. Price at Bid Opening N\$	B. Bid Price after corrections	C. price after Adjustments N\$	D. Price after Margin of Preference [If applicable]	Rank
------	--------------------------------	--------------------------------	-----------------------------------	---	------

Lau Tom Construction cc	8,540,831.50	8,540,831.50	8,540,831.50	N/A	1
Goreseb Trading cc	8,228,035.96	8,228,035.96	8,228,035.96	N/A	2
Nilotse Investment cc	8,657,336.16	8,657,336.16	8,657,336.16	N/A	3
Namshine Investment	8,316,420.27	8,316,420.27	8,316,420.27	N/A	4
Hibachi Investment Holdings (PTY) LTD	8,657,591.67	8,657,591.67	8,657,591.67	N/A	5
Ondjove Trading & Constructions cc	8,523,860.84	8,523,860.84	8,523,860.84	N/A	6
Danny's Building Construction cc	8,775,066.87	8,775,066.87	8,775,066.87	N/A	7
Earth Ethix cc	8,779,783.50	8,779,783.50	8,779,783.50	N/A	8
Pisces Investment Holdings	8,150,321.07	8,150,321.07	8,150,321.07	N/A	9
Centurion Investments (Pty) Ltd	8,694,308.63	8,694,308.63	8,694,308.63	N/A	10
Alughodi Construction cc	8,767,494.43	8,767,494.43	8,767,494.43	N/A	11
Khan Trading cc	9,380,607.50	9,380,607.50	9,380,607.50	N/A	12
Dotas Trading cc	8,806,102.00	8,806,102.00	8,806,102.00	N/A	13
F. A. Developers cc	9,524,329.90	9,524,329.90	9,524,329.90	N/A	14
Qatar Investments cc	8,478,536.02	8,478,536.02	8,478,536.02	N/A	15
Rhitunga Trading Enterprise cc	9,504,475.71	9,504,475.71	9,504,475.71	N/A	16

Moza Investment cc	9,649,469.45	9,649,469.45	9,649,469.45	N/A	17
XL Investments cc	8,655,809.08	8,655,809.08	8,655,809.08	N/A	18
Pelico Engineering Group	9,116,158.10	9,116,158.10	9,116,158.10	N/A	19
J Three Investment cc	9,341,766.25	9,341,766.25	9,341,766.25	N/A	20
Ebdina Trading Enterprises cc	9,344,152.50	9,344,152.50	9,344,152.50	N/A	21
Shatty Construction cc	9,512,116.90	9,512,116.90	9,512,116.90	N/A	22
Hilger Investment cc	8,795,407.00	8,809,552.00	8,809,552.00	N/A	23
Khankan Trading Enterprises	10,131,937.00	10,131,937.00	10,131,937.00	N/A	24
Kauna Builders	10,377,893.25	10,377,893.25	10,377,893.25	N/A	25
Potenza Investment cc	10,566,102.78	10,566,102.78	10,566,102.78	N/A	26
Brumar Construction cc	9,996,431.41	9,996,431.41	9,996,431.41	N/A	27
Shiveli Trading	12,165,308.64	12,165,308.64	12,165,308.64	N/A	28

#### CONTRACT AREA OTJ-01

Name	A. Price at Bid Opening N\$	B. Bid Price after corrections	C. price after Adjustments N\$	D. Price after Margin of Preference [If applicable]	Rank
Ondjira Komurungu Cleaning Services cc	7,962,673.03	7,962,673.03	7,962,673.03	N/A	1
Goreseb Trading cc	7,766,467.09	7,766,467.09	7,766,467.09	N/A	2
Lau Tom Construction cc	8,084,546.00	8,084,546.00	8,084,546.00	N/A	3
Namshine	7,860,788.32	7,860,788.32	7,860,788.32	N/A	4

Nilotse Investment cc	8,282,876.73	8,282,876.73	8,282,876.73	N/A	5
Centurion Investments (Pty) Ltd	7,987,869.15	7,987,869.15	7,987,869.15	N/A	6
Danny's Building Construction cc	8,251,712.92	8,251,712.92	8,251,712.92	N/A	7
Dotas Trading cc	8,060,168.88	8,060,168.88	8,060,168.88	N/A	8
Kauna Builders	9,262,344.38	9,262,344.38	9,262,344.38	N/A	9
Alughodi Construction cc	8,278,017.98	8,278,017.98	8,278,017.98	N/A	10
F. A. Developers cc	9,186,720.38	9,186,720.38	9,186,720.38	N/A	11
Ondjove Trading & Constructions cc	8,329,194.87	8,329,194.87	8,329,194.87	N/A	12
Pelico Engineering Group	8,200,386.31	8,200,386.31	8,200,386.31	N/A	13
Hibachi Investment Holdings (PTY) LTD	8,738,612.58	8,738,612.58	8,738,612.58	N/A	14
Nirwana Trading Enterprises cc	7,781,722.25	7,781,722.25	7,781,722.25	N/A	15
J Three Investment cc	8,644,722.50	8,644,722.50	8,644,722.50	N/A	16
Earth Ethix cc	8,869,278.57	8,869,278.57	8,869,278.57	N/A	17
Khankan Trading Enterprises	9,273,117.00	9,273,117.00	9,273,117.00	N/A	18
Moza Investment cc	9,342,464.01	9,342,464.01	9,342,464.01	N/A	19
XL Investments cc	8,352,627.10	8,352,627.10	8,352,627.10	N/A	20



Rhitunga Trading Enterprise cc	9,270,017.84	9,270,017.84	9,270,017.84	N/A	21
Queen Mwetako Investment cc	9,191,160.76	9,191,160.76	9,191,160.76	N/A	22
Qatar Investments cc	8,403,916.97	8,403,916.97	8,403,916.97	N/A	23
Shatty Construction cc	9,205,460.78	9,205,460.78	9,205,460.78	N/A	24
Ebdina Trading Enterprises cc	9,179,256.88	9,179,256.88	9,179,256.88	N/A	25
Dinaledi Investments	8,872,447.00	8,872,447.00	8,872,447.00	N/A	26
Pisces Investment Holdings	8,591,182.89	8,591,182.89	8,591,182.89	N/A	27
Potenza Investment cc	10,301,410.34	10,301,410.34	10,301,410.34	N/A	28
Brumar Construction cc	9,666,036.34	9,666,036.34	9,666,036.34	N/A	29
Hilger Investment cc	9,572,993.88	9,572,993.88	9,572,993.88	N/A	30
Shiveli Trading	11,046,103.34	11,046,103.34	11,046,103.34	N/A	31

#### CONTRACT AREA OTJ-14

Name	A. Price at Bid Opening N\$	B. Bid Price after corrections	C. price after Adjustments N\$	D. Price after Margin of Preference [If applicable]	Rank
Lau Tom Construction cc	8,711,227.00	8,711,227.00	8,711,227.00	N/A	1
Kauna Builders	9,245,266.88	9,245,266.88	9,245,266.88	N/A	2
Hibachi Investment	8,623,780.92	8,623,780.92	8,623,780.92	N/A	3

Holdings (PTY) LTD					
Earth Ethix cc	8,671,070.84	8,671,070.84	8,671,070.84	N/A	4
Nilotse Investment cc	8,970,291.24	8,970,291.24	8,970,291.24	N/A	5
Centurion Investments (Pty) Ltd	8,535,242.98	8,535,242.98	8,535,242.98	N/A	6
Ondjove Trading & Constructions cc	8,628,828.12	8,628,828.12	8,628,828.12	N/A	7
Danny's Building Construction cc	8,953,217.64	8,953,217.64	8,953,217.64	N/A	8
F. A. Developers cc	9,746,359.25	9,746,359.25	9,746,359.25	N/A	9
Rhitunga Trading Enterprise cc	9,171,387.43	9,171,387.43	9,171,387.43	N/A	10
Alughodi Construction cc	9,027,436.18	9,027,436.18	9,027,436.18	N/A	11
Shatty Construction cc	9,313,046.15	9,313,046.15	9,313,046.15	N/A	12
Queen Mwetako Investment cc	9,442,127.79	9,442,127.79	9,442,127.79	N/A	13
J Three Investment cc	9,442,362.50	9,442,362.50	9,442,362.50	N/A	14
XL Investments cc	8,891,649.93	8,891,649.93	8,891,649.93	N/A	15
Khankan Trading Enterprises	10,048,119.25	10,048,119.25	10,048,119.25	N/A	16

Moza Investment cc	9,969,932.13	9,969,932.13	9,969,932.13	N/A	17
Pisces Investment Holdings	8,945,249.32	8,945,249.32	8,945,249.32	N/A	18
Qatar Investments cc	9,121,911.37	9,121,911.37	9,121,911.37	N/A	19
Brumar Construction cc	9,961,454.43	9,961,454.43	9,961,454.43	N/A	20
Ebdina Trading Enterprises cc	10,019,524.50	10,019,524.50	10,019,524.50	N/A	21
Dinaledi Investments	9,680,707.88	9,680,707.88	9,680,707.88	N/A	22
Potenza Investment cc	10,983,886.06	10,983,886.06	10,983,886.06	N/A	23
Shiveli Trading	11,414,920.99	11,414,920.99	11,414,920.99	N/A	24

#### CONTRACT AREA OTJ-15

Name	A. Price at Bid Opening N\$	B. Bid Price after corrections	C. price after Adjustments N\$	D. Price after Margin of Preference [If applicable]	Rank
Khan Trading cc	9,245,034.00	9,245,034.00	9,245,034.00	N/A	1
Kauna Builders	9,696,601.63	9,696,601.63	9,696,601.63	N/A	2
Lau Tom Construction cc	9,245,494.00	9,245,494.00	9,245,494.00	N/A	3
Nilotse Investment cc	9,371,258.86	9,371,258.86	9,371,258.86	N/A	4
Ondjove Trading & Constructions cc	9,074,779.26	9,074,779.26	9,074,779.26	N/A	5
Danny's Building Construction cc	9,284,428.33	9,284,428.33	9,284,428.33	N/A	6

F. A. Developers cc	10,217,768.40	10,217,768.40	10,217,768.40	N/A	7
Dotas Trading cc	9,130,128.99	9,130,128.99	9,130,128.99	N/A	8
Alughodi Construction cc	9,413,102.88	9,413,102.88	9,413,102.88	N/A	9
Hibachi Investment Holdings (PTY) LTD	9,746,487.16	9,746,487.16	9,746,487.16	N/A	10
Earth Ethix cc	9,735,089.94	9,735,089.94	9,735,089.94	N/A	11
Rhitunga Trading Enterprise cc	9,866,374.86	9,866,374.86	9,866,374.86	N/A	12
J Three Investment cc	9,804,095.00	9,804,095.00	9,804,095.00	N/A	13
Nirwana Trading Enterprises cc	8,944,955.53	8,944,955.53	8,944,955.53	N/A	14
Shatty Construction cc	9,970,948.50	9,970,948.50	9,970,948.50	N/A	15
XL Investments cc	9,309,623.18	9,309,623.18	9,309,623.18	N/A	16
Moza Investment cc	10,501,822.43	10,501,822.43	10,501,822.43	N/A	17
Khankan Trading Enterprises	10,714,394.75	10,714,394.75	10,714,394.75	N/A	18
Hilger Investment cc	9,580,698.99	9,580,698.99	9,580,698.99	N/A	19
Qatar Investments cc	9,503,740.86	9,503,740.86	9,503,740.86	N/A	20
Brumar Construction cc	10,465,848.42	10,465,848.42	10,465,848.42	N/A	21
Ebdina Trading Enterprises cc	10,468,363.75	10,468,363.75	10,468,363.75	N/A	22
Pisces Investment Holdings	9,909,385.15	9,909,385.15	9,909,385.15	N/A	23

Potenza Investment cc	11,584,252.86	11,584,252.86	11,584,252.86	N/A	24
Dinaledi Investments	10,523,289.66	10,523,289.66	10,523,289.66	N/A	25
Shiveli Trading	12,134,148.24	12,134,148.24	12,134,148.24	N/A	26

#### CONTRACT AREA OTJ-02

Name	A. Price at Bid Opening N\$	B. Bid Price after corrections	C. price after Adjustments N\$	D. Price after Margin of Preference [If applicable]	Rank
Khan Trading cc	9,592,679.00	9,592,679.00	9,592,679.00	N/A	1
Hibachi Investment Holdings (PTY) LTD	9,315,132.02	9,315,132.02	9,315,132.02	N/A	2
Lau Tom Construction cc	9,701,101.00	9,701,101.00	9,701,101.00	N/A	3
Kauna Builders	10,288,993.65	10,288,993.65	10,288,993.65	N/A	4
Nilotse Investment cc	9,764,497.34	9,764,497.34	9,764,497.34	N/A	5
Earth Ethix cc	9,537,644.43	9,537,644.43	9,537,644.43	N/A	6
Centurion Investments (Pty) Ltd	9,440,268.43	9,440,268.43	9,440,268.43	N/A	7
Danny's Building Construction cc	9,693,370.36	9,693,370.36	9,693,370.36	N/A	8
Ondjove Trading & Constructions cc	9,642,555.54	9,642,555.54	9,642,555.54	N/A	9
F. A. Developers cc	10,722,858.75	10,722,858.75	10,722,858.75	N/A	10
Alughodi Construction cc	9,785,423.37	9,785,423.37	9,785,423.37	N/A	11
Dotas Trading cc	9,610,739.64	9,610,739.64	9,610,739.64	N/A	12
Hilger Investment cc	9,396,264.64	9,396,264.64	9,396,264.64	N/A	13

Rhitunga Trading Enterprise cc	10,541,401.03	10,541,401.03	10,541,401.03	N/A	14
XL Investments cc	9,606,874.37	9,606,874.37	9,606,874.37	N/A	15
J Three Investment cc	10,247,983.50	10,247,983.50	10,247,983.50	N/A	16
Shatty Construction cc	10,434,022.45	10,434,022.45	10,434,022.45	N/A	17
Nirwana Trading Enterprises cc	9,415,618.10	9,415,618.10	9,415,618.10	N/A	18
Moza Investment cc	10,966,114.69	10,966,114.69	10,966,114.69	N/A	19
Qatar Investments cc	9,918,000.14	9,918,000.14	9,918,000.14	N/A	20
Khankan Trading Enterprises	11,399,202.50	11,399,202.50	11,399,202.50	N/A	21
Ebdina Trading Enterprises cc	10,972,874.50	10,972,874.50	10,972,874.50	N/A	22
Brumar Construction cc	11,069,564.40	11,069,564.40	11,069,564.40	N/A	23
Dinaledi Investments	10,857,038.85	10,857,038.85	10,857,038.85	N/A	24
Potenza Investment cc	12,121,945.14	12,121,945.14	12,121,945.14	N/A	25
Pisces Investment Holdings	10,684,072.24	10,684,072.24	10,684,072.24	N/A	26
Shiveli Trading	12,373,739.24	12,373,739.24	12,373,739.24	N/A	27

9. Best Evaluated Bid:

Contract Area	Area Code	Proposed Bidder	Bid Amount N\$ (Inc. VAT)
Grootfontein	BMU-OTJ 06	Namshine Investment	8,926,340.00

Grootfontein	BMU-OTJ 08	Goreseb Trading cc	8,629,128.43
Otjiwarongo	BMU-OTJ 09	Danny's Building Construction cc	7,876,587.35
Outjo	BMU-OTJ 11	Dotas Trading cc	8,806,102.00
Usakos	BMU-OTJ 01	Ondjira Komurungu Cleaning Services cc	7,962,673.03
Usakos	BMU-OTJ 14	Lau Tom Construction cc	8,711,227.00
Usakos	BMU-OTJ 15	F. A. Developers cc	10,217,768.40
Usakos	BMU-OTJ 02	Khan Trading cc	9,592,679.00

  
**CONRAD M LUTOMBI**  
**CHIEF EXECUTIVE OFFICER**

