



Safe Roads to Prosperity

Executive Summary of Bid Evaluation Report

Project Title: Cleaning of Rest Places and Road Reserve in the Windhoek Region

Reference number of procurement: W/ONB/RA-08/2017

1. Scope of Contract:

Cleaning of Rest Places and Road Reserve in the Windhoek Region

2. Procurement method used:

Open National Bidding

3. Date of Invitation of Bids:

14 December 2017

4. Closing date for submission of bids:

13 February 2018

5. Date and place of opening of bids:

13 February 2018, Roads Authority Head Office – Windhoek

6. Number of bids received by closing date:

116

7. Responsiveness of bids:

74

Bidder's Name	Pricing at Bid Opening (N\$)				Responsive or not responsive (Yes/ No)	Reasons why bid is not responsive
	Area 1	Area 2	Area 3	Area 4		
Uanopaua Trading Centre cc	3,372,993.01	4,504,082.21	3,187,155.80	2,714,498.99	No	Letter of Bid not filled in, Period of validity of the bid not indicated on Letter of Bid.
E&B Trading Enterprises cc	2,553,212.75	2,879,902.75	1,562,439.45	1,695,934.90	No	No Bid Security submitted, Authorized representative is not indicated on the Form of bid, Letter of Bid not filled in, Most bid forms are not filled in, Period of validity of the bid not indicated on Letter of Bid.
Matanna Investment cc	5,470,954.33	5,513,212.76	6,074,695.28	5,970,420.88	No	Bid Submission Sheet Form partially completed.
Simtari Investments cc	3,031,999.06	3,518,473.28	3,090,258.38	2,952,054.60	No	No relevant contracts listed in bid forms, No reference letters provided by contracting parties to the contracts successfully completed.
Nessipark Investments cc	3,621,035.18	3,723,341.55	3,808,551.95	3,501,914.68	Yes	None
Hilger Investment cc	4,273,435.65	4,268,241.88	4,432,656.14	4,201,794.27	No	No reference letters provided by contracting parties to the contracts successfully completed
Ele's Blessing Investment cc	4,280,088.39	4,263,044.94	4,603,112.36	4,302,905.09	No	Bid Security date of 2 June 2018 is not valid. It should be valid for 30 days after the tender validity period (ITB 20.2), Period of validity of the bid not indicated on Letter of Bid.
Kanduu Designing and Construction cc	2,979,302.40	3,177,311.60	3,111,020.60	2,883,601.20	No	No Bid Security submitted, First page of Letter of Bid not filled in, Most bid forms not filled in, Period of validity of the bid not indicated on Letter of Bid.
Pandu Construction cc	736,420.51	830,050.94	749,899.59	525,528.28	No	No Bid Security submitted, Bid tender summary not filled in, Period of validity of the bid invalid for 30 days.
Tobosho Investments cc	3,113,332.87	2,787,244.71	2,598,029.30	2,282,300.35	No	Period of validity of the bid not indicated on Letter of Bid.
Vardah Investments cc	4,945,344.95	4,708,021.97	4,943,615.57	5,142,027.66	No	No Bid Security submitted, Period of validity of the bid not indicated on Letter of Bid.

Baobab Trading Enterprises cc	3,449,963.66	4,411,207.05	4,211,399.42	3,271,462.04	No	No Bid Security submitted.
DJ Proudly Investments cc	5,418,539.68	6,373,820.10	5,270,470.42	5,054,082.24	No	Bid Security date of 1 June 2018 is not valid. It should be valid for 30 days after the tender validity period, which is 13 June 2018 (ITB 20.2), Period of validity of the bid invalid for 792 days.
NRH Investments cc	2,855,524.42	3,024,124.13	2,983,817.75	2,755,009.09	No	No relevant contracts listed in bid forms, No reference letters provided by contracting parties to the contracts successfully completed.
Okarindi Trading Enterprises cc	2,821,262.96	2,766,355.38	2,937,226.27	2,212,853.66	No	No Bid Security submitted.
Hui Tani Trading Enterprises cc	2,786,166.55	2,768,918.02	2,941,464.02	2,245,693.78	No	Letter of Bid not filled in, Bid Security date of 7 April 2018 is not valid. It should be valid for 30 days after the tender validity period, which is 13 June 2018 (ITB 20.2), Most bid forms not filled in, Period of validity of the bid not indicated on Letter of Bid.
John Namusheshe Construction Investment cc	4,140,657.53	4,149,930.69	4,301,447.03	4,076,580.12	No	Bid Security from FNB Ongwediva Branch. FNB Namibia indicated that only the Windhoek branch issues bid securities. Bid securities from other branches are invalid.
Gari'licious Investment cc	3,009,738.28	3,074,996.79	3,146,657.75	2,906,875.78	No	One contract (2015) listed for past 3 years (insufficient for requirement), One reference letter provided by contracting parties (insufficient for requirement).
Epyenene Trading Enterprises cc	4,287,458.98	4,287,657.57	3,587,699.39	4,211,804.85	No	No Bid Security submitted.
Eshisha F. Technology cc	5,370,669.33	6,053,846.24	5,537,192.16	4,215,508.77	No	No Bid Security submitted, First page of Letter of Bid not filled in.
Ngarizemo Transport and Construction	2,863,407.00	3,141,943.00	3,012,761.00	2,743,584.00	No	No Bid Security submitted, Most bid forms not filled in, Period of validity of the bid invalid for 365 days.
Chobezi Trading Enterprises cc	2,014,795.62	2,538,290.47	1,950,460.88	1,690,768.59	No	No Bid Security submitted, Letter of Bid not filled in, Period of validity of the bid not indicated on Letter of Bid.

Kandjai Investment cc	2,203,045.19	2,340,550.56	1,842,096.92	1,516,503.51	No	Bid Security has no revenue stamp and date of 14 May 2018 is not valid. It should be valid for 30 days after the tender validity period, which is 13 June 2018 (ITB 20.2), Letter of Bid not filled in, Bid document not signed or initialed, Period of validity of the bid not indicated on Letter of Bid.
Belba Construction cc	3,083,657.36	3,292,058.42	3,211,574.50	2,978,332.45	No	No undertaking on the part of the Bidder that the salaries and wages payable to its personnel in respect of this proposal are compliant to the relevant laws, Remuneration Order, and Award.
Edge Investment cc	2,986,492.61	3,354,662.34	2,132,706.36	2,227,001.41	No	No Bid Security submitted
FA Developers cc	4,078,962.65	4,587,548.74	4,286,812.49	3,888,405.83	Yes	None
Ditshetlo Investments cc	2,669,862.80	2,932,316.68	2,834,312.20	2,576,448.14	Yes	None
Doema Investment cc	2,308,754.38	2,539,320.52	2,394,616.54	2,278,619.20	No	No Bid Security submitted, Letter of Bid not filled in, Period of validity of the bid not indicated on Letter of Bid.
Enro Road Closure cc	No Offer	No Offer	2,782,154.03	2,530,183.43	No	Period of validity of the bid invalid for 60 days.
Goreseb Trading cc	3,738,246.23	4,713,932.18	4,632,186.36	3,319,635.77	Yes	None
Alugodhi Construction and Renovation cc	3,591,403.50	3,679,139.90	3,795,217.77	3,444,411.58	No	No reference letters provided by contracting parties to the contracts successfully completed.
Ovakuatjivi Trading Enterprises cc	3,176,350.49	3,218,716.60	3,702,417.81	2,765,011.70	No	No Bid Security submitted.
M & B Trading Enterprises cc and Heinrich African Trading Enterprises cc (JV)	1,762,847.45	2,332,772.84	1,718,954.11	1,449,466.10	No	Letter of Bid partially filled in.
Ombuka Enterprise cc	3,339,558.62	3,545,808.58	3,420,321.24	3,204,862.02	No	Bid Security has date of 19 May 2018 is not valid. It should be valid for 30 days after the tender validity period, which is 13 June 2018 (ITB 20.2). Letter of Bid is not filled in, Most bid forms not filled in, Period of validity of the bid not indicated on Letter of Bid.

Kaeruka Construction and Maintenance cc	3,061,825.55	2,781,053.38	No Offer	3,128,776.36	No	No Bid Security submitted, Authorized representative is not indicated on the Form of bid, Letter of Bid not filled in, Most bid forms not filled in, Period of validity of the bid not indicated on Letter of Bid.
Filo's Investment cc	4,039,093.14	4,570,228.05	4,539,841.49	3,829,243.55	No	No Bid Security submitted.
DPD Civil and Road Maintenance cc	2,677,134.48	2,592,974.86	1,695,158.51	1,655,790.13	No	No relevant contracts listed in bid forms, No reference letters provided by contracting parties to the contracts successfully completed.
Hamunyela Civil Works and Building cc	5,876,309.56	7,095,157.83	6,263,679.13	5,370,336.13	No	No reference letters provided by contracting parties to the contracts successfully completed, No proposals for acquisition of (own, lease or hire) of the essential equipment.
Amarising Services and Technology cc	1,984,127.00	2,513,014.21	1,953,410.22	1,670,071.72	No	No Bid Security submitted, Letter of Bid not filled in, Bid document not initialed or signed, Period of validity of the bid not indicated on Letter of Bid.
Lwendo Loke Investment cc	2,888,449.39	3,128,792.81	2,996,249.91	2,762,694.22	No	Period of validity of the bid not indicated on Letter of Bid.
Sacharias Investment cc	2,780,513.01	2,876,203.68	2,752,917.65	2,544,813.15	No	No signed and dated balance-sheet or the profit and loss account has been submitted, No proof of construction financial income has been submitted.
//Gubasen Trading Enterprises	3,848,103.30	3,086,416.50	3,101,161.42	3,358,846.40	No	Pages missing for Letter of Bid (part d to part o), Period of validity of the bid not indicated on Letter of Bid.
Obrien and Fortune Investment cc	2,933,476.41	3,232,395.49	3,106,434.69	2,786,337.20	No	No Bid Security submitted.
Gisella Cleaning Services	2,049,188.43	2,436,204.17	1,865,892.58	1,759,759.46	No	No Bid Security submitted.
Totoo Investment cc	2,838,147.99	3,092,803.13	2,764,369.54	2,490,604.80	No	No Bid Security submitted.
Niilotse Investment cc	3,331,711.46	3,314,989.11	3,368,066.61	3,088,750.50	No	Bid Security has date of 24 April 2018 is not valid. It should be valid for 30 days after the tender validity period, which is 13 June 2018 (ITB 20.2).
Pigeon Industry cc	4,587,953.87	3,567,704.80	4,483,813.06	3,593,011.13	No	Only proposal for LDV vehicle and trailer. No proposals for acquisition of (own, lease or hire) of the other essential equipment. (insufficient for requirement).

M.N. Kashona Investment cc	6,808,546.25	7,603,156.00	7,292,661.75	5,665,429.00	No	No Bid Security submitted, Period of validity of the bid invalid for 1350 days.
Brumar Construction cc	3,597,665.06	4,291,768.54	4,070,707.05	3,166,993.68	Yes	None
Treffy Trading cc	3,340,429.33	3,787,300.45	3,643,434.03	3,066,526.98	No	No references provided by contracting parties to the contracts successfully completed, only sub-contract agreement.
Opuwo Vatu Vahimba Investments cc	2,793,157.90	7,647,597.90	2,846,136.20	2,828,552.60	No	Some amounts in the bill of quantities are filled in pencil and not indelible ink.
Norah Upholstery Services cc	3,100,235.96	3,293,989.01	3,278,869.63	3,126,707.08	No	No Bid Security submitted.
Golden West Investments cc	3,788,667.49	4,791,070.87	4,675,641.77	3,363,204.90	No	Letter of Bid partially filled in.
JA Investments cc	2,876,337.80	2,993,618.70	2,935,604.98	2,681,615.44	No	No Bid Security submitted.
P.T Puye Trading cc	3,937,803.96	3,387,479.62	3,464,578.84	3,298,550.75	Yes	None
Tempo Investments cc	3,642,370.05	3,740,591.71	3,791,052.30	3,453,338.73	No	Letter of Bid is not filled in.
E & Jay Trading Enterprises cc	3,314,678.09	3,963,199.02	3,715,727.50	3,166,993.68	Yes	None
Prudentia Investments cc	4,239,670.80	4,692,502.14	4,781,595.14	4,010,138.93	No	Relevant contracts provided do not indicate the year or project costs, No references provided by contracting parties to the contracts successfully completed.
Mono Trading cc	8,867,508.00	6,554,503.82	7,823,278.75	5,723,579.88	No	One contract (2014) listed for past 3 years (insufficient for requirement), No references provided by contracting parties to the contracts successfully completed.
Mafukutu Investment cc	1,976,206.48	2,476,109.12	2,423,640.06	1,597,695.00	No	Letter of Bid not filled in, Period of validity of the bid not indicated on Letter of Bid.
Asha Trading Enterprises	2,516,411.12	No Offer	No Offer	No Offer	No	No Bid Security submitted, Period of validity of the bid not indicated on Letter of Bid.
Dankiero Trading Enterprises	2,748,880.32	2,873,154.07	2,828,706.65	2,572,268.91	No	One contract (2016) listed for past 3 years (insufficient for requirement), No references provided by contracting parties to the contracts successfully completed, No proposals for acquisition of (own, lease or hire) of the essential equipment.

Esvute Engineering cc	3,400,793.92	3,698,177.98	3,590,563.49	3,282,575.87	No	No relevant contracts listed in bid forms, No references provided by contracting parties to the contracts successfully completed.
Kunene River Construction and Electrical cc	3,706,124.14	6,923,053.54	4,593,221.20	3,305,224.26	Yes	None
Onandjila Investment cc	743,908.39	939,120.22	1,458,296.84	611,390.39	No	No Bid Security submitted, Form of bid not filled in, First page of Letter of Bid partially filled in, Most bid forms not filled in, Period of validity of the bid not indicated on Letter of Bid.
L.N. Investments cc	4,683,557.51	4,496,499.43	4,573,958.54	4,676,527.90	No	First page of Letter of Bid partially filled in, Period of validity of the bid not indicated on Letter of Bid.
Jep Investment cc	3,033,235.72	2,351,916.46	2,622,465.18	2,097,154.95	No	No Bid Security submitted.
Kizo Investment cc	3,615,691.31	4,137,056.00	3,919,178.73	3,416,840.90	No	Bid Security has date of 31 May 2018 is not valid. It should be valid for 30 days after the tender validity period, which is 13 June 2018 (ITB 20.2).
Am-Pm Investments cc	3,687,409.47	4,940,296.09	4,700,722.61	3,505,617.34	No	No references provided by contracting parties to the contracts successfully completed.
Caslano Investments cc	3,438,203.66	3,755,972.19	3,628,369.46	3,268,448.18	Yes	None
Dareva Investments cc	2,697,384.80	3,307,310.88	3,055,998.39	2,886,835.75	No	One contract listed for past 3 years (insufficient for requirement), One reference letter provided by contracting parties (insufficient for requirement).
RFK Trading cc	3,459,204.99	4,099,141.42	3,455,587.22	385,495.47	No	No Bid Security submitted.
WT Business Group cc	2,178,106.85	1,975,256.66	2,161,785.95	1,425,947.22	No	Form of bid not filled in.
Inek Investment cc	3,478,996.12	3,531,929.02	3,602,112.48	3,427,402.39	No	Form of bid partially filled in, Letter of Bid partially filled in.
Pefimbo Renovations and Auctioneering Services cc	2,381,844.67	2,534,915.16	2,454,898.22	2,311,445.95	No	Form of bid not filled in, Most bid forms not filled in.
Mubuyu Investment	No Offer	1,714,275.86	2,145,100.70	No Offer	No	No Bid Security submitted, Letter of Bid not filled in, Most bid forms not filled in, Period of validity of the bid invalid for 60 days.

Metanga Investment cc	2,455,531.73	2,530,165.08	2,547,026.90	2,417,731.25	No	Bid Security has date of 31 May 2018 is not valid. It should be valid for 30 days after the tender validity period, which is 13 June 2018 (ITB 20.2).
Florida Trading cc	2,644,799.76	2,599,109.39	1,695,670.52	1,662,122.97	No	Bid Security has date of 31 May 2018 is not valid. It should be valid for 30 days after the tender validity period, which is 13 June 2018 (ITB 20.2).
Lyatema Investment cc	2,882,030.30	3,003,580.58	2,945,092.48	2,686,359.16	No	Bid Security has date of 12 June 2018 is not valid. It should be valid for 30 days after the tender validity period, which is 13 June 2018 (ITB 20.2), Bid form for equipment is not filled in.
Insomnia Investment cc	3,064,719.80	3,353,696.21	3,158,932.38	2,937,772.75	No	No undertaking on the part of the Bidder that the salaries and wages payable to its personnel in respect of this proposal are compliant to the relevant laws, Remuneration Order, and Award
Eilands Weide Investments cc	No Offer	No Offer	1,670,721.04	1,132,349.57	No	No relevant contracts listed in bid forms, Only proposal for trailer. No proposals for acquisition of (own, lease or hire) of the other essential equipment. (insufficient for requirement).
Sacky Mbady Trading cc	4,134,989.76	4,143,855.52	4,296,295.29	4,071,897.24	No	No Bid Security submitted.
Thusy Construction and Cleaning cc	3,126,343.61	4,183,752.84	2,972,068.42	2,767,851.63	No	Letter of Bid not filled in, Period of validity of the bid not indicated on Letter of Bid.
Twalonga Pro-Construct cc	4,442,171.51	4,894,885.95	4,687,877.35	3,969,076.97	No	No relevant contracts listed in bid forms, No references provided by contracting parties to the contracts successfully completed.
Bero Trading Enterprises cc	1,974,321.68	1,841,885.54	1,883,581.26	2,132,106.90	No	Period of validity of the bid invalid for 60 days.
GHG Trading Enterprises cc	2,027,538.21	2,293,575.54	1,865,892.58	2,135,960.85	No	Only proposal for water tanker. No proposals for acquisition of (own, lease or hire) of the other essential equipment. (insufficient for requirement).
Kazu Investment cc	3,043,125.06	3,324,042.37	3,259,134.93	2,951,012.24	No	Period of validity of the bid invalid for 1095 days.
Hadavi Investments cc	3,545,958.03	3,725,198.57	3,723,407.33	3,380,168.55	No	No Bid Security submitted, Form of bid not filled in, Most bid forms not filled in.
Ndinependa Trading Enterprises cc	2,991,086.40	3,300,995.62	3,153,930.70	2,871,723.31	Yes	None
Dinaledi Investments cc	4,281,556.82	4,371,020.60	4,142,822.03	4,142,057.81	Yes	None

Nallah Investment cc	3,038,992.81	3,095,011.24	3,174,138.25	2,928,159.00	No	No Bid Security submitted, Letter of Bid partially filled in.
Ekodhi Investments cc	4,388,017.33	4,240,711.37	4,137,064.22	4,594,153.63	No	No Bid Security submitted.
Proventures Investments cc	3,545,958.03	3,725,198.57	3,723,407.33	3,380,168.55	No	No Bid Security submitted, Letter of Bid not filled in, Parts of bid document written in pencil and not indelible ink, Period of validity of the bid not indicated on Letter of Bid.
Franka Investments cc	No Offer	No Offer	No Offer	No Offer	No	No Bid Security submitted, Letter of Bid is not filled in, Period of validity of the bid not indicated on Letter of Bid.
Dotas Trading cc	No Offer	No Offer	No Offer	No Offer	No	Bid Security has date of 24 April 2018 is not valid. It should be valid for 30 days after the tender validity period, which is 13 June 2018 (ITB 20.2), Period of validity of the bid invalid for 1095 days.
Deco Engineering and Construction	2,460,651.18	2,526,170.85	2,527,685.05	2,509,291.95	No	No Bid Security submitted.
M'bwadji Trading Investment cc	No Offer	No Offer	No Offer	1,094,792.47	No	No references provided by contracting parties to the contracts successfully completed, No CV for site foreman and site agent.
Multi Solutions cc	15,368,674.75	16,999,096.56	13,971,817.47	12,551,962.50	No	Bid Security has date of 24 April 2018 is not valid. It should be valid for 30 days after the tender validity period, which is 13 June 2018 (ITB 20.2).
D-Square Trading Enterprises cc	3,828,799.84	3,632,956.03	3,649,698.94	3,451,932.00	No	Bid Security from FNB Ongwediva Branch. FNB Namibia indicated that only the Windhoek branch issues bid securities. Bid securities from other branches are invalid.
Rex Regis Trading cc	7,431,592.91	7,512,501.04	6,779,258.34	7,398,194.38	No	Bid Security has date of 9 May 2018 is not valid. It should be valid for 30 days after the tender validity period, which is 13 June 2018 (ITB 20.2).
Rocco Cleaning Services cc	5,001,682.49	4,951,472.11	4,817,437.20	5,126,350.52	No	Bid Security has date of 2 June 2018 is not valid. It should be valid for 30 days after the tender validity period, which is 13 June 2018 (ITB 20.2).
Lizma Trading Enterprises cc	1,977,606.13	1,988,801.38	2,010,040.73	1,853,984.00	No	Bid Security has date of 12 June 2018 is not valid. It should be valid for 30 days after the tender validity period, which is 13 June 2018 (ITB 20.2).

Rhitunga Trading Enterprises cc	3,459,829.46	4,104,566.15	3,459,548.24	3,393,348.91	No	Bid Security has date of 31 May 2018 is not valid. It should be valid for 30 days after the tender validity period, which is 13 June 2018 (ITB 20.2).
Itumuleng Construction and De-bushing cc	2,372,877.51	2,546,697.86	1,837,430.08	1,554,361.03	No	No relevant contracts listed in bid forms, No references provided by contracting parties to the contracts successfully completed, Only proposal for LDV vehicle and trailer. No proposals for acquisition of (own, lease or hire) of the other essential equipment. (insufficient for requirement).
Mundu Mundu T. Investments cc	2,731,074.71	2,696,078.93	2,698,694.08	2,695,267.19	No	No Bid Security submitted.
Tshabalala Trading Enterprises cc	2,069,992.87	2,352,777.30	1,883,668.81	1,955,190.33	No	No Bid Security submitted, Bid document is not initialed or signed.
Clouds Trading Enterprise cc	3,108,173.20	3,260,390.61	3,164,868.97	3,070,389.28	No	Bid Security has date of 31 May 2018 is not valid. It should be valid for 30 days after the tender validity period, which is 13 June 2018 (ITB 20.2).
Mude and Rua Investment	2,313,693.02	2,424,675.05	1,950,695.53	2,064,147.43	No	No Bid Security submitted.
T.A. Cleaning Service	No Offer	No Offer	2,134,836.00	No Offer	No	No Bid Security submitted, only a copy.
Sizwe Trading Namibia cc	No Offer	No Offer	No Offer	154,354.20	No	No Bid Security submitted.
Geronny Investment cc	2,369,434.38	2,489,502.19	2,168,650.86	1,782,505.55	No	No Bid Security submitted, Letter of Bid is not filled in, Period of validity of the bid not indicated on Letter of Bid.
Gotty Dausab Trading cc	2,393,268.50	2,519,022.09	2,011,329.82	2,206,996.92	No	No Bid Security submitted. Letter of Bid partially filled in, Period of validity of the bid not indicated on Letter of Bid.
Kheibs Construction and Works cc	2,507,686.67	2,769,356.22	1,954,663.00	2,199,012.75	No	Period of validity of the bid invalid for 60 days.
Efidi Lomulunga Trading Enterprises cc	5,270,172.16	5,600,182.50	5,080,786.48	5,363,374.83	No	No Bid Security submitted.
Alicia Investments cc	3,399,815.90	3,228,700.87	3,048,668.37	3,495,785.10	No	Bid document altered with most pages missing, Period of validity of the bid not indicated on Letter of Bid.
Vuktune Investment	2,731,847.45	2,425,410.43	2,112,593.01	1,927,682.90	No	No Bid Security submitted.
Ditshetlo Investments cc	2,669,862.80	2,932,316.68	2,834,312.20	2,576,448.14	No	Price bid lower than price margin.

Ndinependa Trading Enterprises cc	2,991,086.40	3,300,995.62	3,153,930.70	2,871,723.31	No	Price bid lower than price margin.
--------------------------------------	--------------	--------------	--------------	--------------	----	------------------------------------

8. Price comparison for bids that are substantially responsive:

Name	A. Price at Bid Opening (N\$)				B. Bid Price after corrections (N\$)	C. Price after Adjustments (N\$)
	Area 1	Area 2	Area 3	Area 4		
Nessipark Investments cc	3,621,035.18	3,723,341.55	3,808,551.95	3,501,914.68	None	No Adjustments
FA Developers cc	4,078,962.65	4,587,548.74	4,286,812.49	3,888,405.83	None	
Goreseb Trading cc	3,738,246.23	4,713,932.18	4,632,186.36	3,319,635.77	None	
Brumar Construction cc	3,597,665.06	4,291,768.54	4,070,707.05	3,166,993.68	Area 4: 3,216,733.48	
P.T Puye Trading cc	3,937,803.96	3,387,479.62	3,464,578.84	3,298,550.75	None	
E & Jay Trading Enterprises cc	3,314,678.09	3,963,199.02	3,715,727.50	3,166,993.68	None	
Kunene River Construction and Electrical cc	3,706,124.14	6,923,053.54	4,593,221.20	3,305,224.26	None	
Caslano Investments cc	3,438,203.66	3,755,972.19	3,628,369.46	3,268,448.18	None	
Dinaledi Investments cc	4,281,556.82	4,371,020.60	4,142,822.03	4,142,057.81	None	

9. Best Evaluated Bid:

Contract Area 1: Gobabis	Caslano Investments cc	N\$ 3,438,203.66,
Contract Area 2: Windhoek	Nessipark Investments cc	N\$ 3,723,341.55,
Contract Area 3: Okahandja	Nessipark Investments cc	N\$ 3,808,551.95,
Contract Area 4: Rehoboth	Brumar Construction cc	N\$ 3,216,733.48.



CONRAD M LUTOMBI
CHIEF EXECUTIVE OFFICER

